
Gasoline, Heating Oil, Diesel Fuel 3/27/2018

Quantity Base Delivery Discount Price Total Math Total Bid Variance

Riggins
Gasoline Small Tank 20000 $1.6725 $0.1619 $1.8344 $36,688.00 $36,688.00 $0.00
Gasoline Large Tank 325000 $1.6725 $0.0265 $1.6990 $552,175.00 $552,175.00 $0.00
Heating Oil Small Tank, ULS 50000 $1.8470 $0.1619 $2.0089 $100,445.00 $100,445.00 $0.00
Heating Oil Large Tank, ULS 55000 $1.8470 $0.0339 $1.8809 $103,449.50 $94,045.00 $9,404.50 *
Diesel Fuel Small Tank, ULSD 25000 $1.9165 $0.2170 $2.1335 $53,337.50 $53,337.50 $0.00
Diesel Fuel Large Tank, ULSD 165000 $1.9165 $0.0445 $1.9610 $323,565.00 $323,565.00 $0.00
Grand Total $1,169,660.00

Mansfield Oil
Gasoline Small Tank 20000 $1.6725 $1.6725 $33,450.00 NO BID #VALUE!
Gasoline Large Tank 325000 $1.6725 $0.0663 $1.7388 $565,110.00 $565,110.00 $0.00
Heating Oil Small Tank, ULS 50000 $1.8470 $1.8470 $92,350.00 NO BID #VALUE!
Heating Oil Large Tank, ULS 55000 $1.8470 $0.0707 $1.9177 $105,473.50 $105,473.50 $0.00
Diesel Fuel Small Tank, ULSD 25000 $1.9165 $1.9165 $47,912.50 NO BID #VALUE!
Diesel Fuel Large Tank, ULSD 165000 $1.9165 $0.0731 $1.9896 $328,284.00 $328,284.00 $0.00
Grand Total $1,172,580.00

Petroleum Traders
Gasoline Small Tank 20000 $1.6725 $1.6725 $33,450.00 NO BID #VALUE!
Gasoline Large Tank 325000 $1.6725 $0.0396 $1.7121 $556,432.50 $556,432.50 $0.00
Heating Oil Small Tank, ULS 50000 $1.8470 $1.8470 $92,350.00 NO BID #VALUE!
Heating Oil Large Tank, ULS 55000 $1.8470 $0.0479 $1.8949 $104,219.50 $94,745.00 $9,474.50 *
Diesel Fuel Small Tank, ULSD 25000 $1.9165 $1.9165 $47,912.50 NO BID #VALUE!
Diesel Fuel Large Tank, ULSD 165000 $1.9165 $0.0580 $1.9745 $325,792.50 $325,792.50 $0.00
Grand Total $1,160,157.00

PAPCO, Inc. *Note on Proposal Form - Generator Delivery fee is $155.00
Gasoline Small Tank 20000 $1.6725 $0.3250 $1.9975 $39,950.00 $39,950.00 $0.00
Gasoline Large Tank 325000 $1.6725 $0.0424 $1.7149 $557,342.50 $557,349.00 -$6.50
Heating Oil Small Tank, ULS 50000 $1.8470 $0.2399 $2.0869 $104,345.00 $104,345.00 $0.00
Heating Oil Large Tank, ULS 55000 $1.8470 $0.0608 $1.9078 $104,929.00 $104,929.22 -$0.22
Diesel Fuel Small Tank, ULSD 25000 $1.9165 $0.3140 $2.2305 $55,762.50 $55,762.50 $0.00
Diesel Fuel Large Tank, ULSD 165000 $1.9165 $0.0495 $1.9660 $324,390.00 $324,395.94 -$5.94
Grand Total $1,186,719.00

James River Solutions
Gasoline Small Tank 20000 $1.6725 $0.2000 $1.8725 $37,450.00 $37,450.00 $0.00
Gasoline Large Tank 325000 $1.6725 $0.0350 $1.7075 $554,937.50 $554,937.50 $0.00
Heating Oil Small Tank, ULS 50000 $1.8470 $0.2000 $2.0470 $102,350.00 $102,350.00 $0.00
Heating Oil Large Tank, ULS 55000 $1.8470 $0.0410 $1.8880 $103,840.00 $94,400.00 $9,440.00
Diesel Fuel Small Tank, ULSD 25000 $1.9165 $0.2000 $2.1165 $52,912.50 $52,912.50 $0.00
Diesel Fuel Large Tank, ULSD 165000 $1.9165 $0.0620 $1.9785 $326,452.50 $326,452.50 $0.00
Grand Total $1,177,942.50

Superior Plus Energy
Gasoline Small Tank 20000 $1.6725 $0.3975 $2.0700 $41,400.00 $41,400.00 $0.00
Gasoline Large Tank 325000 $1.6725 $0.0975 $1.7700 $575,250.00 $575,250.00 $0.00
Heating Oil Small Tank, ULS 50000 $1.8470 $0.3975 $2.2445 $112,225.00 $112,225.00 $0.00
Heating Oil Large Tank, ULS 55000 $1.8470 $0.0975 $1.9445 $106,947.50 $106,947.50 $0.00
Diesel Fuel Small Tank, ULSD 25000 $1.9165 $0.3975 $2.3140 $57,850.00 $57,850.00 $0.00
Diesel Fuel Large Tank, ULSD 165000 $1.9165 $0.0975 $2.0140 $332,310.00 $332,310.00 $0.00
Grand Total $1,225,982.50

Anaylsis Prepared by Phil Ceresini

Notes:
Total Math is calculated from unit price
Total Bid is as reported on Bid sheet
Variance reflects amount of difference from bid sheet
*All analysis for Heating Oil Large Tank based on 55,000 gallons because of conflicting information on proposal forms.
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