
Sec. 4-27 . - Amendments'

INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE 2018

CHAPTER 1 ADMINISTRATION

Section 101 Title, is amended and shall read as follows:

10{.1 Tige These regulations shall be known as the Building Code of the CITY oF WILMINGToN

hereinafter referred to as "this code'"

section ,|01 Title, is amended by adding a new subsection and shall read as follows:

101.1.1Terms,

Whenever, in this building code, a jurisdiction is mentioned without name, it shall mean the City

of Wilmington. Wheneveia state ii mentioned, it shatl mean the State of Delaware' Whenever

the term ,'ouiicinj official,' is mentioned, it shall mean "The commissioner of Licenses and

lnspection or their authorized representative'"

section 1o1.2.1Appendices, is amended by adding the following appendix:

Provisions in the appendices shall not apply unless specifically adopted'

The City of Wilmington adoPts:

Appendix E Accessibility Requirements

APPendix F RodentProofing

Appendix G Ftood Resisfance Construction

APPendix J Grading

SECTION 103 DEPARTMENT OF BUILDING SAFETY

section 103.1 creation of enforcement agency' is amended and shatl read as follows:

The Department of Licenses and lnspections is hereby created and the building official in charge

thereof shall be known as the commissioner of Licenses and lnspections.

Sectionl03.2Appointmentisamendedandshallreadasfollows:

The buitding official shail be appointed by Mayor of the city of wilmington, the chief appointing

authoritY of the jurisdiction.

Section 103.3 Deputies is amended and shall read as follows:

ln accordance with the prescribed procedures of this jurisdiction and with the concurrence of the

appointing autnoiiiy,'itrl'wtuyo, shait have the authority to appoint a deputy building official and the

human ,"rour."r-'d"p"rt*.int shail have the authoiity to select the related technical officers,

inspeciors, ptan lxaminers and other employees' Such employees shall have- powers as delegated by

the building official. For the maintenance'of Lxisting properties, see chapter 34 of the wilmington city

Code and ihe lnternational Property Maintenance Code'

sEcTloN{04DUTIESANDPowERSoFBUILD|NGoFFlclAL

section 104.1 General. ls amended by adding new subsection section 104'1'1 and shall read as

follows:

Page 1



The building official is hereby authorized and directed to enforce the provisions of this code. The

buitding ofi[ial shall have the authority to render interpretations of this code and to adopt policies and

proced-ures in order to clarify the application of its provisions. Such interpretations, policies, and

procedures shall be in comptiance with the intent and purpose of this code. Such policies and

procedures shall not have the effect of waiving requirements specifically provided for in this code'

Section 104.1.1- General Qualifications of building official:

The qualifications of the building official and assistants shall be as determined by the Human Resource

Department.

Section 104.7 Department records, is amended and shall read as follows:

Section 104.7 Department Records, The building official shall keep official records of applications

received, permits and certificates issued, fees collected, reports of inspections, and notices and orders

issued. Such records shall be retained in the official records for the period required for retention of

prOt6 ,"".otds. "Building plans and specifications may, at the discretion of the building official be

destroyed three years ift'er ttre completion of the project, except where retention is mandated to

preserve vital records and plans with the state bureau of archives for permanent storage."

SEGT]ON 105 PERMITS

Section 105.1 Required is amended by deleting Section 105.1.1 and Section 105.1'2 in its entirety

105.1.1 Annual permit. (Delete) Not applicable

105.1.2 Annual permit records. (Delete) Not applicable

section 105.2 Work exempt from permit is amended and shall read as follows:

Exemptions from permit requirements of this code shall not be deemed to grant authorization for any

work to be done in'any manner in violation of the provisions of this code or any other laws or ordinances

of this jurisdiction. Permits shall not be required for the following:

Building:

permits will be issued only to general contractors with a current City of Wilmington business

license, except that permits may be issued to owners, tenants or their authorized agents, for

buildingi additions and alterati-ons, not exceeding a cost of $10,000.00. lt shall be unlawful

for any of the aforesaid persons to proceed with work wiihout having first obtained the

permit-s required by this code and any other provisions of the Wilmington City Code' No

o"rmit shiii, however, be required for the followinq items, subiect to thg exception as noted:

1. Storm doors (except in city historic districts)

2. Front doors (except in city historic districts)

3. Down sPouts

4' Gutters

S. Roof maintenance, minor repairs only are exempted. Re-roofing, re-shingling, roof

tear otf, 90 lb mineral surface, and hot and cold tar roofing requires a permit'

6. Dry wall (less than 100 square feet or three sheets, whichever is larger); for

partitions of a non-structural non-fire related nature only, are exempted'

Page 2



Floor underlaYment

Carpeting

lnterior and exterior Painting

Windows - a permit is not required for Vinyl ReplacementWindows in a one or two

famiiy dwetting, not affecting any framing or structural element, unless in an

Historicat Distr]ct. Commercialwindows are requtred to have a permit.

11. Nonstructural doors (except in historic districts)'

12. lnstallation of plumbing fixtures including faucets, vanities, water closets, tubs, and

shut-off valves for water lines where no in wall piping is affected.

13. Aluminum orvinylwrapping of windows, soffrts and trim(exceptin historicdistricts).

14. concrete sidewalks and/or concrete slabs located on private property (maximum

of 150 sq. ft.)

Plumbing:

1. The stopping of leaks in drains, water, soil, waste or vent pipe provided, however,

tnat if driy cloncealed trap, drain pipe, water, soil, waste or vent pipe becomes

defective and it becomes necessary to remove and replace the same with new

r"toijf, such work shall be considered as new work and a permit shall be

obtained and an inspection made as provided in this code'

2. The clearing of stoppages or the repairing of leaks in pipes, valves or fixtures, and

tt''" r".oui1 and ieinitallation of waier closets, provided such repairs do not

involve or require the replacement or rearrangement of valves, pipes or fixtures'

section 105.2.'l Emergency repairs is amended and shall read as follows:

where equipment replacements and repairs must be performed in an emergency situation, the permit

apptication in"tt n" submitted within the next working business day to the buitding official. Any persons

performing emergency repairs must be a city of wilmington license holder'

section 105.3.{ Action on application is amended and shall read as follows:

section 105.3.1. Action on application. The building official shall examine or cause to be examined

"ri 
,ppriCions for permits and amendments thereio within a reasonable time after filing. lf the

application or the construction documents do not conform to the requirements of all pertinent laws, the

building officiat ,n"ri i"iiri tuch apptication in writing, stating the reasons therefore. lf the building

official is satisfied that the proposed'work conforms to tre requirements of this code and all laws and

ordinances appricaore tnereto,'the building official s.hall issue a,permit therefore as soon as practicable'

ln any instance in *f.ri"f.r tne building offiiial considers an application for a building permit upon which

there has oeen a recommendation irade to the building official by the design review and preservation

commission (,'DR'pC;t;;J the nuitding officiat decision is at variance with such recommendation by

the DRpC, tnen no ptrmit it'r"tt be isiued as a result of a decision by lle building official until the

expiration or lre pelSJ oitir" for the firing of any appeal of the building official's decision directing the

building officiat t" i5u" sucn permit niy sugir ippeats from the building official's decision shall

proceed as proviieJ in tn* 2o'iing code ind in the rules of the zoning board of adjustment and no

action shall o" tar"n priiu"nt to iuch building permit until.there has been a decision by the zoning

board of aOlustmeni ai..'A tn" expiration of the 30-day appeal period following such decision'

Section 105.3.2 Time limitation of application is amended and shall read as follows:

An application for a permit for any. proposed work shall be deemed to have been abandoned 90 days

after the date of tiiinb, unress su6n apptication has been pursued in good faith or a permit has been

issued; except that ihe building official is authorized to grant one or more extensions of time for

7,

8.

9.

10

Page 3



additional periods not exceeding 90 days each. The extension shall be requested in writing and

j ustifiable cause demonstrated'

Section 105.4 Validity of permit is amended by adding new subsections Section 105.4.1, Section

los.4.2,Section 105.i.3, S-ection 10s.4.4, Section 105.4,5, Section 105.4.6 and shall read as follows:

section 105.4.1 lssuing permits. Permits wlll be issued only to general contractors with a current

city of wilmington busiiebs license, except that permits may be issued to owners, [enests or their

auihorized agents, for buitdings, additions and alterations, not exceeding a cost of $10,000.00. lt shall

be unlawful for any of the af6resaid persons to proceed with work without having first obtained the

permits required Oy tnis code and any other provisions of the Wilmington City Code' Work items

exempt for permits see Section 105.2'

Section 105.4.2. Plans. No permit will be issued for construction, alteration, repair, addition, or

modification unless the plans and specifications have been professionally prepared by and have the

signature and seal of the appropriate design professional, expert in that discipline, as defined by the

pffifessional regi-tration and licensing laws of the State of Delaware, licensed by the City of

witmington, an; registered with the State Board of Architects or registered with the Delaware

Association of Professional Engineers except:

(a) Any singte famity dwellings, and any sheds (100 sq/ft), storagg buildings and garages

incidentil to such dwellings, not exceeding 2 /' stories and 1,500 square feet. en-the-first

fl€€+.

(b) Alterations to any building, the cost of which does not exceed $25,000.00, do not require

change of use, siructuralihanges involving design or change of structural beams, support,

columns or stabs, do not affect other safety features of the structure, and alterations do not,

as required by he building otficial, endanger the life or health of the building's occupants.

Sealed and signed plans are required for any/all commercial roofing projects.

Section i05.4.3. Denial of permit. The building official may deny a permit application for the

following reasons:

(1) The building official has reason to believe that the work descrtbed in the application cannot

be perform6d in a safe and workmanlike manner or within a reasonable time;

(2) The building official believes that the work described in the permit application cannot be

completed i-n conformance with this code, or other applicable laws;

(3) The applicant has demonstrated to the building official an inability to complete work

described in other permits within a reasonable time or in a safe and workmanlike manner; or

(4) The appticant has submitted false or misleading information on the application for the permit.

Section 105.4.4. Denial of demolition permit. No demolition permit shall be issued for the demolition

of any dwelling *nicn ir subject to the provisions of the housing code requiring the annual registration

of such dwelling 
"na 

tn" payment of vacant dwelling registration fees if, as determined by the code

otti"i"t, the dwelling has not been so registered or such regislration fees have not been paid; provided,

however, tne nuiiJilg otriciat may issuei demolition permit if in his judgment the immediate demolition

oitne owetting is ieq"uired for the safety of nearby residents, or in an emergency, or if the code official

determines that rehabilitation of such dwelling ii not financially feasible._Upon proper registratio_n of

such dweiling 
"nd 

p"d.niof vacant dwelling iegistration fees, the code official may issue a demolition

permit.

section 105,4.5. Revocation of permits, The building official may revoke a permit or approval issued

under this code for the following reasons:

(1) The building official has discovered any false statement or misrepresentation on the

application dr ptans on which the permit or approval was based;

Page 4



(2) The building official has reason to believe that the work for which the permit has been taken

cannot be completed in a safe and workmanlike manner, or within a reasonable time;

(3) The buitding official becomes aware that the permit holder is no longer able to complete the

work;

(4) The building official discovers that the authorized work is not substantially commenced within

90 days after the permit is issued, or that the authorized work is suspended or abandoned,
or that no substantial work is per-formed for a period of 90 days after the work has

commenced;or

(5) The permit or approval was issued in error, or on the basis of incorrect information supplied,

or in violation of any ordinance or regulation or any of the provisions of this code. Further,

the issuance or granting of a permit or approval of plans and specifications shall not be

construed to be a permit for, or an approval of, any violation of any of the provisions of this
code or of any other ordinance of the city. No permit presuming to give authority to violate
or cancel any provisions of this code shall be valid.

Section 105.4.6. Gity-sponsored housing program authorization. The City of Wilmington, acting

through its Department of Real Estate and Housing ("Department") shall be authorized to conduct a

city-sponsored housing program, to be coordinated by that department with the Department of

Liienses and lnspections, the Finance Department, and other departments as may be necessary, to

waive building permit fees that are otherwise required by the Building Official, provided that each

retevant permlt itself is obtained for each of the dwellings that are part of the city-sponsored housing

program, for dwellings that are being, or will be, constructed or substaniially rehabilitated as part of

bity:sponrored programs, conducted throughout the year and coordinated on behalf of the City by the

Department of Reat Estate and Housing. Such work may include, but shall not be limited to carpentry,

electrical work, painting, new construction or rehabilitation of dwellings in the city-sponsored housing

project or program. The authorization for waiver of building permit fees shall apply only to permits for

work conducted as parl of the city-sponsored housing proJects or program.

Section 105.7 Placement of permit is amended and shall read as follows:

The building permit or copy shall be kept on the site of the work until the completion of the project.

All permits ihoutd be posted at the site and visible to the building official and the general public.

SEGTION 107 SUBMITTAL DOCUMENTS

Section 107.1 General is amended and shall read as follows:

Section 107.1 General. Submittal documents consisting of construction documents, statement of

special inspections, geotechnical reports and other data shall be submitted in two or more sets with

each permit application and one in electronic format as required by the code official. The construction

documents slrall be prepared by a registered design professional licensed by the State of Delaware-
where required by the statutes of the City of Wilmington. Where special conditions exist, the building

official is authoriied to require additional construction documents to be prepared by the registered

design professional, When it is required that documents, including but not limited to construction

docriments for new construction, change of occupancy, alteration, repairs, expansion, addition or

modification for buildings or structures, including mechanical, electrical, and plumbing work which

involve the practice of architecture or engineering, as defined by the professional registration or

ticensing laws of the State of Delaware, are to be prepared by_ a registered design professional

consisteit with the professional registration of licensing laws of the State of Delaware, the Code official

shall be authorized to require the owner to engage and designate on the building permit application a

registered design professional who shall act as the registered design professional in responsible

.f,irg". lf the 
-circumstances require, the owner shall designate a substitute registered design

profe"ssionat in responsible charge who shall per{orm the duties required of the original registered

i"rign professionai in responsible charge. The Code official shall be notified in writing by the applicant

it tnj r|gistered design professional in responsible charge is changed or is unable to continue to

Page 5



perform the duties. with a job valuation of $25,000 and up, sealed and signed plans are required for

[ritOi,.tg, structural, mecnahicat, electrical, and plumbing drawings. Separate mechanical, electrical,

"no 
pru"rni.g orawings;itn a vatue under $25,000 may be required to be sealed/signed as, required

OV ifi" buitdiig official, e.g. kitchen hood plans, ventilation air, etc.

For projects that have civil components, approvals must be received by the Department of Licenses

"no 
iniir..iions from the Department of Public works in order for final permit issuance'

For projects that have Fire Protection Systems, approvals must be received by the Department of

r_icenses and lnspections from the Fire Marshal's Office in order for final permit issuance.

Exception: The buitding officiatis authorized to waive the submission of consfruction documenfs and

other data not r"quir"o io be prepared by a registered design professional if it is found that the nature

oi tne *orr. apptieo for is such'that review of construction documents is not necessary to obtain

comPliance with the code.

section 107 .1.1 contract Requirements A copy of the executed contract between the contractor

and the owner or responsible party, signed by both pqrties, shall include labor, materials and

construction fees inclusive of the propos6d wori. A list of the trades included in the contract shall

;;;;d.y ttre sign;J ;ontract. Atternatety, a letter that serves as notice to proceed on the owner's,

or responsibr" p"ftvt retterhead which shilt inctude a list of trades associated with project and all

it"*r ii.t"O preuiouity in this section and signed by the contractor may be submitted'

Section lOT.2.Construction Documents is amended and shall read as follows:

Section 107.2 GonstructiOn Documents. construction documents shall be in accordance with

section 1o7.2.1tnrougn rc7.2.5.The application for permit shall be accompanied by not less than two

or more sets with *r"X pei*it applicati6n and one in electronic format as required by the code official.

However, at tne o[cietion of the'Buitding officiat, enc an archival grade DVD-R may be substituted

in lieu of a third sei or ora*ings at the ti-me of permit issuance. The disc shall be a color copy of the

nppiou"o" reo stampel Jruiing. for permit; stamped, signed, and dated by the city of wilmington

plans Examiner. This disc will be a permanent record of the approved drawings issued for permit' The

applicantmay snari picr up ih" ".onirr.tor copy " of the approved drawings for reproduction, and return

the DVD-R to tn" S"partment of Licenses ino tnspeciions; and, after receipt of the DVD-R to the

Department, tn" po*iiirilt be issued. . The Code oticiat is permitied to waive the requirements for

filing construction-oocuments when the scope of the wo-rk isof a minor nature. when the quality of the

materials is essential for conformity to this code, specific information shall be given to establish such

quality, and this cooe snatt not be cited, or the ierm "legal" or its equivalent used as a substitute for

specific information'

Section 107 .2.1.1. lnformation on Construction documents

construction documents shall be dimensioned and drawn to suitable scale (for example %"=1'0") upon

suitable materiari no r*rir"r than 1 t " niln X 17" wide and. no larger than 30' high X 48"wide and

shal be 
"rricieniciaiitv "no 

iii" to indicaie the tocation , nature, and extent of the work proposed and

show in oetairtnaiilre worr. will conform-to tre provision of .the 
adopted codes as determined by the

Buitding officiar. t-nl 
-euitoing 

officiar snati navd the authority to reject plans based on size and /or

legibility of the construction documents'

section 1o7.2.1.2Minimum DeSign Requirements for Non-residential construction documents

lncluding Multi Unit Apartments and Hotels

Any requirements that are not applicable to a specific project shall list the requirement and define as not applicable

on the consffuction documents'

Page 6



l. Code data
i. Project name and address.

ii. Deiign professional name and contact number'

iii. Building code(s) and edition utilized'

iv. OccupancY tYPe

v. Building/Construction tYPe.

vi. If an automatic sprinklei system is provided and whether the sprinkler system is required

vii. The allowable and actual building height'

viii. The allowable and actual building area'

ix. Occupant load as defined in Table 81004.1.2 of the International Building Code.

x. The egress width required and provided'

xi. The plumbing fixtures required and provided'

Z. Means of egress.The construction documents shall show in sufficient detail the location, construction, size and

ctraracter of aTt portions of the means of egress in compliance with the provisions of this code. In other than

o."upun.i., in broups R-2, R-3 and I-1 the construction documents shall designate the number ofoccupants to be

accommodated on every floor, and in all roorns and spaces'

3. Exterior wall envelope. Construction documents for all buildings shall describe the exterior wall envelope in

sufficient detail to detel.;ine compliance with this Chapter. The construction documents shall provide details of the

exterior wall envelope, including *indo*r, doors, flashing, intersections with dissimilar materials, cotners, end

ariuifr, control joints, intersectiJns at roof, eaves, or parapets' means of drainage, water resistive membrane' and

details around openings. The construction documents shall include manufacturing installation instructions that

provide supporting doiumentation that the proposed penetration and.opening details described in the construction

documents maintain the wind and the weather resistance of the exterior wall envelope. The supporting

documentation shall fully describe the exterior wall system that shall be tested, where applicable, as well as the test

procedure used.

4. Minimum design requirements for swimming pools. Construction documents shall accurately show dimensions

and consffuction ofthe pool and appurtenances and properly established distances to lot lines' buildings, walks and

fenceso as well as details of the waiir supply system, drainage and water disposal systems,-and all appurtenances

prrtuining to the swimming pool. netaiiea ionstruction documents of structures, vertical elevations and sections

ihrough pool showing depth shall be included'

5. Minimum design requirements for non-residentiql Mechanical docwnents' The Mechanical consh'uction

documents shall include, but are not limited to:

i. plans must be d.u*n to scale. plans shall be no smaller than I I " X 17" and no larger than 30" X 48",

ii. Equipment schedules to include, but not limited to: listing of equipment' number of units, location of units

and equipment capacity (B.T.U', KW etc')'

iii. Information shall'be piovided on any clearance reduction methods in use'

iv. Ventilation schedule shall list amount of outside air (c,f.m.) supplicd to each room or space, and indicate

(c,f.m.) amounts at each duct/diffuser outlet'

v. butside air calculations for ventilation are shall be included'

vi. Energycalculationworksheets'
vii, Outside air intakes shown on the layout'

viii, Duct construction details, including supports, hanger details, sheet metal thickness and information on

flexible ducts or flexible duct connectors'

ix. Information on au.t linings and insulating materials including flame spread and smoke development

ratings.
x. Exhaust fan ductwork layout and termination outside. This includes dryer and toilet room exhausts'

xi. Boiler and water heater equipment and piping details shall include, but not be liniited to:

a. safety controls
b. airt iUutlon piping layouts, indicating locations of backflow protection devices and provide

Iistings ofall backflow protection devices'

PageT



XII.

c. gas and fuel oil piping layouts, ,materials, demand ofgas appliances, sizes and locations ofvalves,

indicating design pressures (high or low)'

d. locations of all fiLe and smoke dampers and access panels for fire dampers and/or equipment.

e. Boiler installations may require final inspections from the State of Delaware.

Non-residential kitchen exhaust shall include, but not be limited to:

a. equipment details, including hoods

b. listings, clearances to combustibles, fan information, discharge location and duct work layout for

intake and exhaust ducts

c. percentage ofmakeup air and general design calculations such as are velocity

d. iocationi spacing or cleanouts, listings ofcleanouts, pitch ofhorizontal ductwork, gauge ofall

metal used

e. details on chimney and chimney connector or vent connector details and connector gauges and

clearances

mechanical refrigeration equipment data and details

solid fuel buming equipment details including firepiaces, wood ovens, and grills and equipment

listings with manufactures' Iistings for all appliances

6. Minimum design requirementsfor non-residential Plumbing documents. The Plumbing construction documents

shall include, but not limited to:

l. plans must be drawn to scale. Plans shall be no smaller than I l" X 17" and no larger than 30" X 48",

2, Sewer and water service details shall be provided on civil plans,

3, Exterior water meter settings based on the water purveyor standard details'

4. plunrbing fixture scheduleihall include the calculated occupant load used to determine the number of

required Plumbing fi xtures.

5. itlurnbing plan layout shall include, but not be limited to:

a. Pitch of drainage lines

b' locations of cleanouts

c. size oftraPs
d. Drainage fixtut'e count (DFU) and complete riser diagrams

6. Water supply distribution plans and water riser diagrams shall include:

a. piPe sizes

b. water demand calculations

c. water suPPlY fixture counts

d. materials used and backflow protection devices, including listings of backflow protection

devices

7. Water heater details and locations of relief valve drainage and thermal expansion tanks and defining if
unit(s) are gas or electric.

8. Venting information for all gas-fired equipment'

9, Piping hangar support and spacing details'

tO. S'torm drain details shall include, but not be limited to:

a. roofdrain sizes

b. downsPout/leader sizes

.. ,".onOury (emergency) roofdrains where the roofperimeter extends above the roofsurface

d. calculations
I l. Grease/oil int.r*ptort to include venting. Note: Grease traps shall be located outside the building and

easily accessiUfr for inspection, cleaning, and maintenance. The applicant of such work shall provide a

maintenance plan to the Department of Public works'

12. Kitchen .quip..ni fuyout to include details on indirect or direct drainage. Indicate if discharge will be

through an air gaP or an air break'

13, Dishwashitiglu"ttin.t, autoclaves, and similar equipment to include details on wastewater discharge

temperatures and if chemicals are used in the cleaning process'

t+,'Floordrains,trapsealprimers,andhubdrainsandwastereceptors'
15. All sinks and drains that will receive chemicals (including those found in lab or industrial occupancies)

Neutralizing dwlces to include manufactures' cut sheets. Certifications from the building owner/tenant

relating to Jhemicals used and discharged may be requested'

16. NoIe: Boiler installations may require final inspection from the State of Delaware'

f.
o

Page 8



7. Site ptan. The construction documents submitted with the application for permit shall be accompanied by two (2)

sets of a site plans, and in an electronic format as required by the Building Official, showing to scale the size and

location ofnew construction and existing structures on the site, distances from lot lines, the established street grades

and the proposed finished grades. The site plan shall be drawn in accordance with an accurate boundary line

survey. in t-he case of demolition, the site plan shall show construction to be demolished and the location and size of

existing structures and construction that are to remain on the site or plot, The Building Official is authorized to

waive or modify the requirement for a site plan when the application for permit is for alteration or repair or when

otherwise warranted. Ail site plans shall be dated including the date of any and all revisions.

A plot or moltgage survey plan bearing the seal of a Delaware registered land surveyor or professional engineer will

be accepted to accommodate structures under four hundred eighty (480) square feet, however applications for in-

ground pools must be accompanied by a site plan regardless of pool size.

SECTION {08 TEMPORARY STRUCTURES AND USES

Section 108.1 General is amended and shall read as follouts:

Section 108.1 General. The building official is authorized to issue a permit for temporary structures

and temporary uses. Such permits shall be limited as to time of service, but shall not be permitted for

more than 30 days. The building official is authorized to grant extensions for demonstrated cause.

SECTION {09 FEES

Section 109.1 Payment of fees is amended by adding new subsection Section 109.1.1 and shall read

as follows:

Section 109.{.1 Fees.

(a) No permit to begin work for new construction, alterations, removal, demolition or other

Ouilding operation will be issued until the fees prescribed in this section are paid to the City

of Wilmington.
(b) Should ai increase in the estimated cost of work require an additionalfee, a new permit

shall be issued based on the cost of the additional work as established in Section 109.2.1

below.

(c) Surcharge witt charged to the applicant for failure to.obtain a permit for the required work. lf

that woik has proieeded without required permits, the Department of Licenses and

lnsPection wilt charge:

1. $250.00 flat fee for residential construction work
2. $500.00 flat fee for commercial construction work

The payment of these fees shall not relieve the applicant or holder of the permit from paying other

fees that are'required under this article, this chapter, the Wilmington City Code or other applicable laws.

Section 109.2 Schedule of permit fees is amended by adding new subsections, Section 109.2.1'

Section 1Og.2.z,Section 109:2.3, Section 109.2.3.1, Section 109.2,4, Section 109.2.5, Section 109.2'6'

Section log.z.z,Section 109.2.8, Section 109.2.9, Section 109.2.10, Section 109.6 and shall read as

follows:

Section 1og.2.l Establishing cost base for permit fee. Each applicant shall specify the total cost of

tne proposed ouiroing or imprSvements, including general conditions, labor, and contractor fees, for all

ouiriind, ptumbint, Jlectricat and mechanical woik, and including all equipment, devices and other

materials that hav"e been or will be incorporated in the project under the applicant's contract regardless

of who instals such equipment, devices or other maierials. The fee for such permit shall be based on

Page 9



the total value of such work, as determined by the code official based upon the estimates submitted

dv tn"ippriiant and the code official's own knowledge, and then shall be calculated in accordance

with Section 109.2.2.

section 109.2.2. New buildings, additions and alterations. The fee for every new building or

addition or alterations to an 
"xisting 

building shall be basg! on the value of all work involved to

.o*pf"t" in" project. permit tee is $Tz.oO peievery $1,000.00 rounded up to the next $1,000.00'

Section 1Og.2.2.1Other fees, generatly. Additional permit fees shall be paid for the following

related work in connection with any building permit:

a. Plumbing,....$20.00

b. Heating installation ..."$20.00

c. Air conditioning system '."'$20 00

d. Mechanical ventilation..'. $20'00

e. Electrical work ....'$20.00

f. FiresuPPression....'$20'00

g. Alarm sYstem .....$20.00

h. Access Controls/card reader ""'$20'00

i. Refrigerationequipment""'$20'00

section 109.2.3. Mechanical equipment. For all alterations of mechanical equipment that require the

nN! 
"f 

a special 
"p|fi.ition, 

the permit fee shall be based upon the total value of such work,

determined unaer seciions log.z.l and 109.2.3. This includes, among others, elevators, dumbwaiters,

moving stairways, r"n tiftr, material lifts, automotive lifts, conveyors, brick pointing, sandblasting,

termitiprotection, re-roofing and roof repairs, signs and billboards.

section 10g.2.4.Demolition of building and structures: ln addition to and not in lieu of the aforesaid

fee, prior to issuance of any demolition permit for any structure which is in whole or in part a residential

,iujdtri", the generaiconiactor or demolition coniiactor, as agent for the person, firm, corporation,

plrtr"*nip, aisociation or otn"r. entity who or which owns the structure for the demolition of which

the permit is sought, rnJrr p"v 
" 

'nousing preservation fee' equal to three percent of the estimated fair

market value of tne 
"iiucture 

at the timJ of application for such demolition permit. The estimated fair

market value shall be based upon the assessments for tax purposes maintained by the county board-

of assessment and adopted for tax purposes by the city pursuantlo 22 Del. c. and section 44-31 of

the Wilmington CitY Code'

payment of the housing preservation fee shall not be required if the demolition is part of an incidental

ffie construction of a"nlw residential structure or structures on the same lot or land as that on which

the structure to be demolished is situate and for which new residential construction plans have been

submitted to and uppiou"J 6v the building inspector and a.building permit for the same has been

obtained; nor shall p"1l*"nt,jr the aforesiid fee be required prior to any demolition of a residential

structure which has u6ln oio"r"d by the department oi lic-enses and inspections for reasons of the

public health, safety 
"nO 

*"ffjr"; provided, ltowever, that if the costs of such demolition are not paid

by the owner o,. 
"g";t 

f* the owner of such structure and are incurred by the city, the housing

preservation fee snali'be'impoieo and sha[ be added to the costs of demolition and become a part of

the lien upon such ranJs inl premises upo.n which the structure was situate. lf any building permit for

new residential construction on tne same lot or premises upon which a demolished residential structure

was situate is .roseqiinirv i"uor."J, the housing preservation fee shall be imposed upon the owner

oragentfortheownerofthedemolishedresidentialstructure.

Section 109.2.5. Miscellaneous permit fees'

Page 10



a. The fee for temporary building and structures is $50'00'

b. Tents for religious, educational or recreational purposes only, and not exceeding 30 days' a

fee of $10.00.

c. The fee for the annual permit for electrtcal installations, as provided by Section 2704.3 is

$30'00.

Section 109.2.6. lnspection of annual license permits'

Theaters.....$50,00

Moving picture theaters ."'.$50'00

Assembly halls .....$50.00

Seetion 109.2.7. Fees for certificates and applications'

(a) For certificates of use and occupancy/compliance, the fees shall be as follows:

Dwellings and two-family houses ""'$75'00

Private accessory buildings .....$75'00

All other buildings .....$1 00'00

New construction or alterations where more than one final inspection is requested

...$100.00

Open lot auto parking ...'.$100'00

OPen lot auto sales ..'..$100'00

LumberYards ....'$1 00.00

JunkYards .'...$1 00'00

Premises for other storage use ""'$100'00

Change of occuPancy '....$100'00

Duplicate certificates'.'. $50'00

certificates requested by owner of an existing building '..'.$100.00

Certificate of compliance'.. "$50'00

Temporary certificate of occupancy

Residential'.'..$1 00.00

Commercial'....$250'00

(b) For certificate of registration and operations, the fees shall be as follows:

For certificate of registration ""$50 00

For each elevator .'..'$50'00

For each run of moving stainruay " '$50'00

Page 11



For each manlift .....$50.00

For material lifts, conveyors and power dumbwaiter ""'$50'00

For duplicate certificates ".'.$25.00

(c) For applications to the zoning board of adjustment for permission for any purpose, the fees

shall be as follows:

For residential property or LJse, for each requested variance or special exception\$100.00

For commercial property or use ""'$250'00

(d) For any appeals to the Board of License and lnspection Review, the nonrefundable fee to

be paid at't'he time of filing of the appeal shall be $50'00

Section 10g.2.8. Exemptlons from permit fees; waiver of permit fees for government buildings.

a. A building permit shalt be required for work to be done as part of the federal weatherization

progr"r,"but there shall be an exemption from payment of each permit fee otherwise

ipp'iicaOie. lnspection of work performed under such program will be done by the

department of licenses and inspections, However, any contractor performing any work as-

part of .ul6 progr"m shall hold a valid city business license and provide the department of

licenses-anO'inipections with the address of any property at which location he is working

under the program. Similarly, a building permtt shalt be required for work to be done as part

of new constirction or improvements to existing structures for federal, state, county or city

gou"rnn1lni"l buitdings, but there shall be authorized a waiver of the building permit fees.

otnerwise appii."nf"llnspection of work performed shall be done by the department of

licenses and' inspections, except in connection with federal property, in which cases

inspection rnatt Od done by the federal government..However, any contractor performing any

work as purt oi any federal, state, county or city building construction or improvements shall

hotd a virio city blsiness iicense and provide the department of licenses and inspections

with the ;;r;;; ot uny property owned by federal, state, county or city government at which

tne contracior is perfoiming any wort<. Any violation of the provisions of this subsection shall

be causefor issuance of a stof work order by the department of licenses and inspections.

b. For purposes of this subsection only, "government building" shall mean:

i. A building occupied by the city, county, state, or the United States Government' or any

otner igdncy oi subdivision oi the city county, state, or United States Government; or

ii. Government building project owned by the City of Wilmington, or by any other municipal

.orpootion, or the State-of Delaware, the United States Government wherein:

(1) The project is financed in excess of 50 percent by city, county, state or federal

funds or any combination thereof; and

(2) The project is of or for a governmental or.non-profit organization performing public

tunciions to the extent t-hat such are not engaged in residential, commercial, or

industrial activities'

section 109.6 Refunds, is amended and shall read as follows:

The code official shall have the authority to charge a plan review fee if the pro.lect has been

canceled and the code official has review-ed the project in its entirety. The cost of the plan review

fee will Oe OetermineO by the code official and deducted from any fees refunded'

SECTION It1 CERTIFICATE OF OCCUPANCY

Section 111.3 Temporary occupancy is amended and shall read as follows:

Page L2



Section 111.g,1Temporary occupancy. The building official is authorized to issue a temporary

certificate of occupancy oefor" tne completion of the entire work covered by the permit, if such portion

oi po,tion, shatt 
'be 

occupied safety. The building otficial shall set a time period during which the

t",,,,'por"ry certifica[ oio"iup"n.y is valid. Temporary certificate of occupancies shall be issued in 30-

day increments.

SECTION 113 BOARD OF APPEALS

sEcTtoN 113 BOARD oF APPEALS is amended by adding a newsubsection section 113.4 and shall

read as follows:

Section 1{3.4 Board of Standards and Appeals'

Board of standards and appeals. Pursuant to City Charter sections 3-904 and 5-707' the

board of standards and appeals shall be comprised of the Commissioner of Licenses and

tn"pections ind the arcnitbbt and the engineer on the committee. The member of the Board

of StanOarOs and Appeals who is a builder shall serve in an advisory capacity to the board

of standards and aPPeals'

SECTION ll4VIOLATIONS

section 114.4violation penalties is amended by adding new subsection Section 114-4-1and shall

read as follows:

Section 114.4-1 Violations and penalties'

(a) Any person who violates a provision of. this Code or fails to comply with any of the

reciuiiements thereof, or who erects, constructs, alters or repairs any service equipment or

apptiance toi *ni.f' a permit is required either without first having obtained that permit, or in

viotation of an approved plan or directive of the code official, or of a permit or certificate

issued ,nd"i th" frovisions of this chapter shall be guilty of a misdemeanor, punishable by

a tlne ot.not tesi tnan $250'00 and not more than $1,000'00 or by imprisonment not

exceeOing sx months, or both such fine and imprisonment, for the first conviction' A

.orpor"i''Jn ;1ay be fined by the court an amount not exceeding $5,000-00. Each day that a

viotation continues shall be deemed a separate offense. For any conviction of a violation that

is tne seconJ Conviction for the same violation as a previous violation which has not been

.ou".t"i in" *ini11r'" fine for any person or corporation shall be not less than $500.00'

anO noi-moL tf'"n $5,000.00; for'the third conviction $1,000.00, which shall not be

suspended; for the fourth conviction $1,500,00; and for the fifth and subsequent conviction

of tne saml uiolution that still has not been corrected the minimum fine for each conviction

sfratt oe noit"r, th"n $b,000.00 which shall not be suspended. Upon.conviction of a violation

of this chipter, the court may order the defendant to correct the violation by a date certain'

lf the defendant fails to correct the violation by the court ordered date, the court may impose

a tine oi $S0.00 per day to be calculated from the date of conviction to the date by which the

court had ordered the violation to be corrected'

(b) pursuant to tifle 25, chapter 29 of the Delaware code, any fines imposed by any court for

viotations of inir chaptei shalt give rise to a lien(s). The unpaid amounts of such fines may

ne aOOeO to local property tax b'illlngs for the property which was the subject of said violation'
,,Fines', shall also include any CivitjuOgment entered pursuant to section 4101 ol title 11 of

the Delaware Code'

(c) lssuance of warnings. At the discretion of the Commissioner of Licenses and lnspections or

any of his designees who are authorized by the commissioner to do so, a written warning

may be issued-on a form approved by the cbmmissioner and the city solicitor to the owner'

agent, 
"i:JJr*^ 

i. 
"ontrot 

6i any buititing or structure concerning violations of any provision

of this;ilij'-ih;iis not a life-ihreatening violation. lf any violation concerning which any

,ucr. *aining'nas oeen issued has not blen corrected within the time allowed, then the

Page 13



department of licenses and inspections shall proceed to obtain compliance as provided in
this chapter.

(d) Continuing violations. After conviction and sentencing for violation of any such order of the

commissioner of licenses and inspections based upon and issued pursuant to the provisions

of this chapter or any provision of any rule or regulation promulgated by the department of
licenses and inspections for the enforcement or implementation of this chapter, if such
person shall continue in violation of such order, then such person shall be liable for further
prosecution, conviction, sentencing, and punishment upon such same order, without any

necessity of the commissioner of licenses and inspections issuing a new order until there is
full compliance with such order.

(e) Separate offenses. Each day's failure to comply with any order of the commissioner of
licenses and inspections based upon and issued pursuant to the provisions of this chapter

or the provisions of any rule or regulation promulgated by the department of licenses and

inspections for the enforcement and implementation of this chapter, and each day's failure

to comply with any provision of this chapter or any such rule or regulation shall constitute a

distinct and separate offense and be punishable as such.

(0 The building official is hereby authorized to make inspections to determine the condition of

buildings, dwellings, and premises including the land on which the same are located and

including vacant lots, located within this city, in order that he may perform his duty of
safeguarding the health and safety of the occupants of buildings, dwellings and land, and

the g-eneral pubtic. For the purpose of making such inspections, the building official is hereby

authorized to enter, examine and survey between the hours of 8:00 a.m. and 5:00 p.m. all

buildings, dwellings, lands and premises. The owner or occupant of every building, dwelling,

land and premises, or the person in charge thereof, shall give the building official free access

to such building, dwelling, land and premises during such time for the purpose of such

inspection, examination and survey; provided, that such inspection, examination or survey

shall not have for its purpose the undue harassment of such owner or occupant and that

such inspection, examination or survey shall be made so as to cause the least amount of

inconvenience to such owner or occupant consistent with the etficient performance of the

duties of the code official.

(g) Nothing in this section shall be construed to prohibit the entry of the building official:

(1) At any time when an actual emergency which tends to create an immediate danger to

public safetY exists, or

(2) At any time when such an inspection, examination or survey may be requested by such

owner or occupant; provided, however, that any such requested inspection,

examination or survey is othenivise authorized and, further, that nothing herein shall be

construed to mean that the building official is required to perform such requested

inspection, examination or survey.

(h) For purposes of this section and the enforcement of the provisions of this code, "code official"

shail mean and include the officer or other designated authority charged with the

administration and enforcement of this code and chapter, and a duly authorized

representative, including the city fire marshal and any duly authorized representative of the

firb marshal for purposes of the enforcement of the more stringent oI any provisions involving

fire safety in thii code and chapter and in chapter 12, "fie pr-evention and protection" of the

city Code. Any person who opposes or impedesa building official of the city in the execution

of his Outy hereunder shall be deemed guilty of a vio_lation of this chapter. ln addition, if a

code offiiial of the city is denied entrance to a building, dwelling, land or premises for

purposes of inspection, he may, upon a showing of probable cause, obtain a warrant for

purposes of entering and inspecting the building, dwelling, land or premises.

Page 14



SECTION 116 UNSAFE STRUCTURES AND EQUIPMENT

Section i16.1 conditions is amended by adding new subse^ctions Section 116.1.1, Section 116.1.2,

s""iion 146.i.g section 116.1.A,Section 116.1.5 section 116.1.6, and shall read as follows:

section 116.1.1Building maintenance, etc. - Responsibilities of owner. No person shall own any

;;ikii;g within the ciiv l,unicn does not comply witn tne following requirements, particularly in

connection with any 
"uio"n"" 

of decay of any of ihe items herein enumerated such as to render the

building unsafe:

(a) Foundations, exterior walls and roofs. Every foundation, exterior wall and roof shall be

weathertight, watJrtight, rodentproof and inse6tproof. Any evidence of decay of a foundation,

exterior wlll or roof shall be a violation of this section'

(b) lnterior partitions, walls, floors, and ceilings. Every interior partition, wall, floor and ceiling

shal be ."puOf" of atforCing privacy and shall be kept in a good state of repair.and in a clean

and sanitaiy condition. Any-evidence of decay shall be a violation of this section.

(c) Drainage and removal of rainwater from roofs. All rainwater shall be so drained and\-/ 
.onu"yiC trom every ioof so as not to cause dampness in the walls, ceilings or floors of any

habitable ..oor o1. oi 
"ny 

bathroom. Any evidence of decay of a roof shall be a violation of

this section.

(d) Windows, exterior doors and basement hatchways. Every window, exterior door and

basement narcnway shall be weathertight and rodentproof. Any evidence of decay of a

window, exterior do'or or basement hatchway shall be a violation of this section.

(e) Exterior wood metal surfaces, and public structures, including bridges and appurtenances'

All exterior 
-*ooJ 

metal surfaces, and public structures, including bridges and

appurtenanc"r, .n"ff oe protecteO from the elements and against decay by paint or other

approved prot*tiu* coating applied in a workmanlike fashion. Any evidence of decay such

as cract<ing, scafing peefin-g or'loose paint or decay of any other protective coating shall be

a violation of this section'

(0 stairways, porches, etc. Every inside and outside stainivay, every porch, and every

appurtenance thereto shall be so constructed as to be safe to use and capable of supporting

theloadthatnormalusemaycausetobeplacedthereon'Anyevidenceofdecayofa
stairway,porch,etc''shallbeaviolationofthissection'

(g)Plumbingfixtures;waterandwastepipes.Everysuppliedplumbingfixtureandwaterand
waste pipe rn"ir-6" properly installed'and mainiained in good sanitary working condition'

Any evidenc'e ;iCJt o? ru'"n plumbing fixture, water pipe or waste pipe shall be a violation

of this section.

chimneys and smoke pipes. Every chimney and every supptied smoke pipe shall be

adequatelY suPPorted.

Toilet room and bathroom floors. Every toilet room, floor surface and bathroom floor surface

shall be maintained ro ri to n" itpervious to water and shall be kept in a clean and sanitary

condition,

Facilities, equipment and utilities generally' Every supplied facility, piece of..equiPTqlt 9r

utirity which is requireo'under thiicnaptei shail'be so constructed or installed that it will

trr.li.. pi"perly and shail be maintained in good working condition.

Removing, discontinuing, et9., S.erv'.l.ces, facilities, equipment or utilities' No owner or

operator shal cause 
"n'i"ti"b, 

i"cility equipment or uiitiiy which is required to be supplied

under the provisions ot-itris cnapier to be removed from, shutoff from or discontinued for any

(h)

0)

(i)

(k)

Page 15



occupied building, except for such temporary interruption as may be necessary while actual

repairs, replacements or alterations are in the process of being made.

(l) pest control. Every owner of a building shall be responsible for the extermination of insects,

rodents or other pests on the premises. Whenever infestation exists in any building or any

part of any building, extermination thereof shall be the responsibility of the owner.

(m) Cleanliness, etc., of communal, shared or public areas.. Every owner of a building shall be

responsible for maintaining in a clean and sanitary condition all communal, shared or public

areas of the building and the premises thereof'

(n) Cleanliness, etc., of occupied buildings generally. No owner shall occupy or rent to any other

person for occupancy or allow any other person to occupy any vacant building or any part

itrereof, unless it is ciean, sanitary and in compliance with all provisions of this chapter and

all rules and regulations promulgated pursuant thereto'

(o) Open ditches or excavations. All open ditches or excavations that present a safety or health

hazard shall be filled or protected to eliminate such hazard

(p) Drainage generally. All parts of allbuildings and premises shall be so drained as to prevent

unsani[ary accumulation of water in cellars or basements or any nuisance to or excessive

drainage upon sidewalks and adjoining properties

(q) Structural Analysis - When in the opinion that that the structural integrity is comprised, a

structural analysis must be conducted by a licensed structural engineer to determine the

integrity of the structure and must submit a detailed report on how to repair the current

hazardous situation

(r) Fences

Section 1i6.1.2 Safeguards. When, in the opinion of the building official, there is- actual and

Irnreoi"t. danger of iltapse or failure of a building or structure or any part thereof that would

unO"ng"r life, thie code official shall cause the necessary work to be done, whether it be by demolition,

;il;i;;, o'" oih"r method as determined by the building official in order to render such building, or

.trr.t,ir", or part thereof, temporarily or peimanently safe, whether or not the legal procedure herein

prescribed has been instituted'

Section 1{6.1.3. Disclosure of environmentat conditions applies to any interior or exterior

gi""t"igt"n 160 sq/ft. Every owner or agent for the owner of a property for which a demolition permit

lppli."ti". is fited with the D'epartment oi Licenses and lnspections, shall provide fulldisclosure with

slirr oemorition permit applicaiion of any pending environmental assessment, review, remediation, or

voluntary compliance aciion that has bben issued, ordered or approved by the U.S. Environmental

piol""iion Agency, or by the Delaware Department of Natural Resources and Environmental Control

io1.rnecl. p"o o"*otition permit shallbe issued or approved until such full environmental disclosure

has been filed with the department of licenses and inspections to the satisfaction of the commissioner

of Licenses and Inspections. The purpose and intent of this section is to prevent any property owner,

nriio"r, contractor, developer or oiher person from obtaining a demolition permit from the-city without

trrrv Jid.r"ring ano informing the city officials of known environmental hazards on the site for which an

apftication foia demolition permit has been made. 160 square feet

Section 116.1. .Abatement of public nuisances; governmental demolitions'

(a) N uisances; definitions.

(1) ',Nuisance,, is defined as any condition of the land, or of the buildings ere.cted thereon'

or of the trade or busines's conducted therein or thereon, or of unsightly articles

collected thereon or therein, or of obnoxious odors arising thereon, th-erein, .or
therefrom, or any other condition that arises from the unreasonable, or unlawful use by

" 
p"rron of his own property, real or personal, or from his improper conduct that works

as an injury to the right df tnL puOtic, and produces material annoyance, inconvenience'

Page 16



discomfort or hurt, or that is injurious to the health, or is indecent or offensive to the

senses, so as to interfere with a person's comfortable enjoyment of life or property or

so as to constitute a menace to the public health'

(2\ .'Public nuisance building.' is defined as any of the following:

(A) Any building that, by reason of its condition, endangers public health, life, limb'

satbty, or pioperty, ind is likely to cause harm, inconvenience, damage or injury

to one or more Persons.

(B) Any building that, by reason.of continued vacancy and the lack of reasonable

maintenanc"e, has deteriorated to the point that it is a blighting influence on nearby

properties, and poses a threat to the public health, safety, and welfare.

(b) Emergency demolitions. When, in the opinion of the code official, a building is in such

condition tnat it conititutes a public nuisance building posing an imminent threat to the public

h;;lth, safety and welfare, such that it requires immedtate action and no less drastic means

oi *.inr snbrt of substantial reconstruction are available on an emergency basis, the code

official may eliminate the dangerous condition, demolish the building, or contract with other

persons to Oo so. prior to taking measures to eliminate the dangerous condition, the code

official will make reasonable ettorts to notify the reeeC-+wne+ owner of record of the

"r"ig"r1.V 
condition, the intent to demolish the building or othenruise to eliminate the

O"nl6,.6rd conOition,'and the estimated timeframe within which the dangerous condition

must and shall be abated.

The department of licenses and inspections, in addition to invoking any other sanctions and

procedures;-mayshall, with the approval of the law depaftment, collect the costs incurred by

ine city from the owner of the buiiding by lien, as authorized in 25 Del. C. S 4601 or as may

otherwise be authorized bY law'

(c) Nonemergency demolitions. When in the opinion of the code official, a building is in a

condition sucn tnai it Constitutes a public nuisance building, but does not pose an imminent

threat to tfre public nJ"ftn, safety and welfare such as would require immediate action, the

code officiat may eliminate the dingerous condition or demolish the building' or contract with

other personr to-Jo ro, there beTng no less drastic measures that are reasonable and

available.

(1) procedures: ln all instances of nonemergency demolitions of buildings as authorized

pursuant to gre provisions of this section, the owne(s) of the building that is the object

of the nuisan." In"t"r"nt shall be provided with notice and an opportunity to be heard'

Written noticeifraf f be provided by mailing of a certified letter, return receipt requested,

to the last known address of the record owner, owners or record lien holde(s) notifying

them of tne adOress of the building to be demolished and including the following:

(A) A list of specific conditions of the building that constitute violations of the building

code.

(B) Notice that failure or refusal to correct the conditions within a specified period of

time totiowing the maiting of the notice may lead to demolition of the building'

(c) A concise statement that the owners or lien holders, as the case may be, have

appeltai-e-,id;i; 6 ; administrative hearing before the board of license and

inspeciion ieview wherein they may be represented by counsel, introduce

evioence, examine and cross-examine witnesses, and receive a decision in

writing, wtrictr decision shall include detailed findings of fact.

(D) A concise statement of notice that, if the building is demolished, the city mayshall

lien gre piop"rty to1. the costs incurred by the city in accordance with the provisions

of 25 Del. C. SS 4601 and 4602'

Page L7



(E) A concise statement of notice that the demolition notice and its receipt by the owner

or lien holder do not preclude criminal prosecution of the owner or lien holder.

(F) Following the determination by the code officialthat a building is a public nuisance

nuiiJing,"but that it does not fresent an emergency, the city council by resolution

shall s[ecifically direct the abatement of the nuisance'

(d) ln any demolition, whether governmental or private, whether emergency or non-emergency'

there shalt be landscaping if tne affected lot by improvement with top soil and grass seeding

during the growing s"'asin in which the completion of the demolition occurs, or in the next

immetiate bro*i.g season thereafter, ancl the development of the turf to a level acceptable

to the city, irni"n 
'iorrally 

would mean four inches of topsoil with good germination of grass

seeding. fn 
"CJition, 

there shall be submitted within 30 days of the completion of the

demolition, a detailed development plan for the site, which shall be submitted to the

department of licenses and inspections'

section {16.,|.5 Right of condemnation. All buildings or structures that are or hereinafter shall

become unsafe, ungnit"ry or deficient in adequate exit facilitieso.r which constitute a fire hazard or

are otherwise dangerous tb human life or the public welfare, or which involve illegal or improper use,

o..up"n.y or maiitenance, shall be deemed unsafe buildings or structures and public nuisances. All

such unsafe structures are declared to be illegal and shall be abated by repair and rehabilitation or by

demolition in accordance with this chapter. A vacant building, unguarded or open at the door or

window, or partially or completely boardeo up for a period exceeding 45 days, shall be deemed to be

unsafe within the meaning of this code, a fire hazard and a public nuisance'

section 116.1.6. Boarding of vacant structures in excess of 45 days lt shall be within the discretion

of G oepartment of ticens-es ano inspections to grant an extension of time to permit a vacant building

to remain boarded in Lxclss of 45 days, but no more than six months, if active rehabilitation of the

structure is ongoing and the following requirements are met:

(1) The owner of the property must submit a written letter to the departmeni of licenses and

inspections iiaiing't6d specific work taking place or io take place, including a time table for

each asPect of the rehabilitation;

(2) All necessary building permits must be acquired, or if previously acquired, must be active;

and

The work being performed must be continual throughout the entire period the building

remains boarded'

Section i16.3 Notice is amended with new subsection Section 116.3'1 added and shall read as

follows

section 116.3.1 Notice of UnSafe structure and hearing. lf an unsafe condition is found in the

building or structure, tn" OrlfOing official shall give written notice,. by either mail or service or other form

of delivery, to the ownJr rg#ftr person in cintrol of the structuie, describing the structure deemed

unsafe and stating tne?qu"iieJ iei"irs or improvements to be made to render the structure safe and

secure, or requiring the unsafe structure or portion thereof to be demolished within a specified time' tf

the owner, agent or p"iion in control cannot be found, a copy of the notice shall be posted in a

conspicuous place on ti" pt"*i.". and such a procedure shall be deemed the equivalent of personal

;;rfu. Any notice neiein'required shall, if mailed, be deemed to be effective upon mailing'

such notice shail provide that the person so notified may appear _the 
vioration notice to the board of

licenses and inspectionri*.*. The appeal shall be in writing and filed within ten days after the receipt

of the vioration noticel n.v 
"pp""t 

'io tne board of ticenses and inspections review shall be

accompanied with a nonrutunoabie fee in the amount required by this chapter at the time of filing' The

board of licenses ano'inspection. t*i"* shall hear and oecioe appeals in accordance with its duly

ii""tti6.o .nd promulgated rules, regulations and procedures'

Page L8



SECTTON 116 UNSAFE STRUCTURES AND EQUIPMENT is amended by adding new subsection
Section 116.6 and Section 116.7 and shallread as follows:

Section 116.6. Disregard of unsafe notice. Upon the failure or neglect of the person served with an

unsafe notice to comply with the requirements of the order to abate the unsafe condition, the
jurisdiction shall institute the appropriate action in the courts to compel compliance, or the building

of1cial, with the approval of council, shall have full power to remove the unsafe building or structure

and whatever expense shall be incurred in relation thereto shall be paid by the city treasurer out of

monies in the treasury; and the owner or owners shall be jointly and severally liable to the city for the

full amount so expended. The city may maintain an action of law in debt or assumpsit against such

owner or owners to recover the sums of money so expended, plus lawful interest and cost. When any

person is found guilty, whether by trial or admission, of violating any provision of section 119.0, in

instances in which such person, at the time of sentencing for such violation, also has not reimbursed

the city for the costs incurred by the city in securing and boarding up the open areas of any building or

structure regarding which such person or persons have been found guilty, as provided, the court

having jurisdiction shall order such person or persons to make full restitution to the city for such costs

in addition to and not in lieu of any fines which the court may impose'

Section 116.7. Vacant building.

(a) Rehabilitation or demolition of vacant and boarded buildings. lt shall be unlawful and a
violation for which the owner of the property or the person responsible for the property shall

be tiabte for any vacant building 116.1.4(b) to determine if an emergency demolition is

required because the building is an imminent threat, as provided therein, or subsection

116.1.a(c) to determine if a nonemergency demolition is required because the building

constitutes a Public nuisance.

(b) Secure open areas of building.

(1) Violations. lt shall be unlawful for any owner, agent, or person in control of any building

or structure which is vacant and open or otherwise unsafe to fail to secure and board

up the open areas of any such building. lf, after a reasonable time, the building or

structure is not secured, but rather it remains vacant and open or otherwise unsafe, the

building official or authorized agent or employee of the city may enter upon the
premises, building or structure and secure or board up the open areas of such building

or structure, or cause the same to be done. lf the building official or authorized agent or

employee of the city is denied entrance to a premises, building or structure for purposes

of securing and boarding up the open areas of such building or structure, he may, upon

a showing of probable cause, obtain a warrant for purposes of entering and securing

and boarding up the subject building or structure'

(2) Costs incurred. The owner or owners of the subject building or structure shall be jointly

and severally liable to the city for the full amount so expended in securing and boarding

it up. The owner, agent or person in control of such building or structure shall reimburse

the city for all costi incurred by the city in so securing or boarding up such building or

structure. The city may maintain an action of law in debt or assumpsit against such

owner or owners to recover the amount of money so expended, plus lawful interest, and

costs.

(3) Reimbursement of city at time of sentencing of violator, When any persons are found

guilty, whether by trial or by admission, of -violating 
provisions of this section, in

instances in which such person, at the time of sentencing for such violation, also has

not reimbursed the city for the costs incurred by the city in securing and boarding up

the open areas of any building or structure regarding which such. person or persons

shall 
'be 

found guilty, as provided, the court having jurisdiction shall order such person

or persons to niakefull restitution to the city for such costs in addition to and not in lieu

of any fine which the court may impose'

Page L9



GHAPTER 1 SCOPE AND ADMINISTRATION is amended by adding new Section 117 and shall read

as follows:

Section i12.0 Nonresidential structures maintenance standard is amended by adding Section
ii7.0 and subsections. Nonresidentialstructure maintenance standards is amended by adding

new subsections Sectio n 117.1, Section 117.2, Section 117.3, Section 117.4, Section 117.5,

Section 117.6 and shall read as follows:

The following standards apply to all structures or portions thereof, used or most recently used for
nonresidentill purposes, which are located in commercial or residential districts, as described in

chapter 48, articles lV and V of the Wilmington City Code.

Section 117.1 All exterior surfaces of wood or other fibrous materials shall have a continuous,

tighly adhering, unbroken protective coating of paint or similar material.

Section 117.2 All exterior metal surfaces which are not inherently and permanently resistant to

corrosion shall have a continuous, tightly adhering, protective coating of a material appropriate to

the metal.

section 117.3 All openings, except chimneys, shall be made weathertight.

Section 112.4 Glass panes larger than one square foot which are cracked or broken shall be

replaced.

Section 117.5 Materials used to cover or weatherproof doors, windows, or other exterior

openings shall conform to the standards contained in sections 122.1 and 122.2. The materials

shall be sturdy and shall be maintained in good repair, with any defacing to be eradicated or

covered.

Section 117.6.A11 loose, corroded, rotted or otherwise deteriorated elements of every structure

shall be removed and replaced when necessary to maintain the building in watertight and

weatherProof condition.

CHAPTER 1 SCOPE AND ADMINISTRATION is amended by adding new section 118 and shall read

as follows:

Section 1ig.0. Residential uses in buildings within the downtown area' ln order to encourage

innovative and safe residential uses of the upper floors of structures or buildings within the downtown

area bounded by the centerline of Second Street on the south, the centerline of King Street on the

""ii, 
tn" centerline of Ninth Street on the north, and the centerline of West Street on the west, the

foltowing requirements and standards shall be applicable to all such structures or portions thereof'

used or most recently used for nonresidential purposes or for mixed nonresidential and residential

purposes, when, as, and if such parts of such buildings or structures are renovated for residential uses,

iomptiance with which shall be shown prior to the issuance of a certificate of occupancy.

The floors above the street levelfloor of any building or structure within the downtown area as aforesaid

may be apartments of not less than 150 iquare feet of sleeping area for the first occupancy thereoJ

and at least 100 Jooitional square feet for every additionaloccupancy thereof, and not less than 40

iqu"r" feet of bathroom area, the floor space to be calculated on the basis of total habitable floor area'

exclusive of stairwaYs.

CHAPTER 1 SCOPE AND ADM|N|STRAT|ON is amended by adding new section 119 and shall read

as follows:

section 1{g.0. Authorizations of improvements to exteriors of vacant buildings or structures;

procedures; liens for the costs incurred'

Page 20



(a) Authorization. The Department of Licenses and lnspections is authorized to initiate the

making of improvements to the exteriors of vacant buildings or structures in accordance with

this se-ction and pursuant to the provisions of 25 Del. c. ch. 29 (s 2901 et seq') and 25 Del.

C. ch. 46 (S 4601 et seq.).

1. Eligible buildings or structures. lf the owner has failed to rehabilitate or demolish:

(1) A building that is vacant or abandoned and deemed to be unsafe, or

(2t Any other building or structure that is vacant and amendable to rehabilitation if

made secure, the-commissioner of licenses and inspections may recommend that

exterior improvements be made or caused to be made to such building or structure

so as to render the building or structure safe and secure and to prevent further

structural damage from rain and other natural causes, and that a lien be duly

recorded in ordei that the city may recover the costs incurred by public expenditure

for the same.

Z. Types of improvements, Exterior improvements, authorized herein, may include' but

aie not limited to: Repairs to or replacement of any of the structural components of such

buildings or structures, sidewalks in the right-oFway or on the lot on which the building

or structure is located, steps, porches, railings, columns, windows, doors, exterior

painting, brick pointing and rooiing, and any other repairs or replacements deemed

ippropiiate to protect ind secure the structural integrity of the building or structure and

to ilrevent further damage that would render the building or structure unsafe' The costs

incurred by the city fo-r any such improvements shall be referred to as "exterior

improvement costs.i' Such exterior improvement costs_incurred by tne 9i!V. shall be

recorded Oy tien in accordance with the provisions of 25 Del. C. ch' 46 ($ 4601 et seq.),

3. Approval and certification of improvements to be made. The commissioner of licenses

anO inspections, his duly authorized designee, the director of real estate and housing

and the Oirectoi'ot ptannlng and development, or the duly authorized designee of each

of the same, shal'by maj6rity approval of a written authorization certify that specific

exterior impiovemenis shall 
'be 

made to a building or structure, identified by street

address anO-tax parcel number, in accordance with this subsection' Such written

authorization shall be forwarded to the procurement and records division and to the

finance Oirector wltn specifications prepared for the particular improvements authorized

to be made 
"nO 

fo|. no other improvements. ln an emergency affecting the.public safety

as determined by the commissioner of licenses and inspections or his designee, the

iJnOering of exterior improvements to secure the structure may be expedited in lieu of

the requirements of this certification subsection'

4. Notice to owner. When exterior improvements have been authorized as aforesaid and

specifications for the same have been prepared, the department of licenses and

inspections snatt provlOe notice to the record owner or owners of the subject building or

structure 
"nC 

to any record lien holders that such exterior improvements will be

undertaken 
"nO 

ttt" date Of commencement of the same' For purposes of this

subsection, tna-*"ifing of a certified letter, return receipt requested, at least.30 days

prior to the commence-ment of the exterior improvements, to the last known address of

the record "rr"r, 
owners or lien holders and notifying same of the address of the

property to ol iriroued, the tax parcel number, the condition of the property and the

legal right i1r,"'.iiy to'obtain a judgment against the.owner and a lien against the

p,6-p"rt'V 
"ft"r 

ro*pr"tion of the exleri6r improvements, shall be deemed to be sufficient

notice.

(b) costs incurred as debt owing to city. whatever expenses are incurred in relation to

authorized exterior improu"m6nts puisuant to this subsection shall be paid by the city

treasurer out of monies in the treasury and the owner or owners shall be jointly and severally

liable to the city for the full amount so expended. whenever exterior improvement costs have

been incurreo as atote=iid, the expenditure of public funds for exterior improvements to any

Page 21



vacant or abandoned building deemed to be unsafe or any other vacant building or structure,

following notice to the owners, being the costs so incurred, with legal interest thereon from

the dateof expenditure, shall be reimbursed to the city, on demand, by the person or persons

who were the owner or owners of such building or structure at the time such work of exterior

improvement commenced. The city may maintain an action of law in debt or assumpsit

against the owner or owners to recover the sums of money so expended, plus lawful interest

and cost. When any person is found guilty, whether by trial or admission, of violating any

provision of sections'119.1, or 119.5, or 119.6, or any combination.of the same, in any

instance in which such person, at the time of sentencing for such violation, also has not

reimbursed the c1y for the costs incurred by the city in making or causing to be made any

exterior improvem'ents, pursuant to this subsection, to any building or structure regarding

which suclr person or persons have been found guilty, as provided, the municipal court shall

order such person or persons to make fult restitution to the city for such exterior improvement

costs in addition to and not in lieu of any fines which the court may impose.

(c) Entering of lien. When the city expends public funds for the purpose of exterior improvements

to any vacant or abandoned-buiiding or structure deemed to be unsafe or any other vacant

buildiirg or structure within the city, after such notice as aforesaid, the city may ente.r a lien

for the amount so expended, with interest accrued thereon, on the lands and premises on

which such work of exterior improvements was performed by means of the department of

finance and the city solicitor forwarding directions to the prothonotary for New Castle County

for the entering of such exterior improvement liens in a docket for the same.

(d) Satisfaction. When the department of finance and the city solicitor have determined the

exterior improvement costs and interest, the entering of the lien shall be done by forwarding

to the prothonotary the information as aforesaid. Whenever any such lien is satisfied by

payment, the department of finance and the city solicitor may so advise the prothonotary in

order that there shall be entered in the prothonotary's records the date of final payment and

the words 'satisfied in full' pursuant to 25 Del. C. S 4603(d)'

(e) Rules and regulations. The department of licenses and inspections may adopt rules and

regulations ai deemed necessary and proper for the administration of this subsection,

subject to approval by the administrative board'

CHAPTER 1 SCOPE AND ADMINISTRATION is amended by adding new section 120 and shall read

as follows:

Secfion 120.0. Annual registration of vacant buildings and registration fees.

(a) purpose. The purpose of this section requiring the registration of all vacant buildings'

includint dwelliirgs that are subject to chapter 34 as referenced below, and the payment of

registraiion fees is to assist ttre bity government, particularly the department of licenses and

injpectioni 1Of-ty in protecting thapubtic health, safety and welfare, to monitorthe number

of vacant Oulldings i;t the cityl particularly those that are located in the downtown business

district tfiom Se|ond to 16tlh, and Walnut to West Streets), to assess the effects of the

condition of those buildings on nearby businesses and the neighborhoods in which they are

located, particuiarty in tiglht of fire sifety hazards and unlawful, temporary occupancy by

transients, includin'g illicii drug users and traffickers, and to require of the owners of such

vacant LrifCirgi t[eir registiation and the payment of related fees, and to promote

substantial enjrts to rehabilitate such vacant buildings. The provisions of this section are

applicaOte to the owners of such vacant buildings as set forth herein and are in addition to

anO noi in tieu of any and all other applicable provisions of this chapter, the health and

saniiation code, and iny other applicable provisions of the Wilmington City Code.

(b) Definitions and applicabitity; registration statement and fees.

(1) Definitions. For purposes of fhrb section, the foltowing words and phrases shall have

themeaningsre}spectivetyascribedtothemasfollows:

Page22



(A) Boarded: A building or structure subject to the provisions of this section shall be

deemed to be "boirded" if in place of one or more exterior doors, other than a

storm door, or of one or more windows, there is a sheet or sheets of plywood or

similarmaterialcoveringthespaceforsuchdoororwindow.

(B) Exterior maintenance and maior systems: The phrase 'exterior maintenance and

major systetii' if,"tt mean the safe and lawful maintenance of the facade'

windows, Ooois, roof, and other parts of the exterior of the building and the

maintenance of ils major systems consisting of the roof, theelectrical and plumbing

systems, tne water supply system,.the sewer system, and the sidewalk, drive-way,

if any, rr"" oi}1. iod,'u! appticable and as enforced by the DLl, particularly.in

connection wittr iuOs'ections'119.01 (building maintenance) and 124 (exterior

improvements) of this section of this code'

(c)occupied:Anybuildingorstructureshallbedeemedtobeoccupiedifoneormore\-/ 
p"rson, actuiffy 

"ond"ucts 
a lawful business or resides in all or any part of the

building ". in6 lLensed business-occupant, or as the legal or. equitable

owner/occupant(s) or tenant(s) on a permanent, nontransient basis' or any

combination of tire same. For purposes of this section, evidence offered to prove

that a building ii sooccupied may include, but shall not be limited to, the regular

receipt of deiiv;ry oi regutar m'ait ttrrougn the U.S. Postal Service; proof of

continual tereprrorie, elect-ric, gas, heating, water and sewer services; a valid city

business licerise, oi the most-recent, federal, state, or city income tax statements

indicating tn"iitr'! rrLlect pioperty is the official business or residence address of

the person or businesi claiming occupancy; or proof of pre-rental inspection'

(D) Occupancy ready:Any building that is vacant, but has been recently rehabilitated

and a certificate of occupancy or certificate of completion has been issued by the

DLI allowing [n" ouirOind to be lawfully occupied, or if the property has not been

Lcen1y renaoiiitatJO, th6 property meets all minimum code requirements and.may

be immediat"iy- o.cupi"d. Wn"ine, a building is "occupancy ready" shall..be

determined # Diilhr;ugn an inspection oi tne.building. The classification
,,occupancy relOy;snarr orily appty to the vacant registration requirements of this

section, and doei not apply to any other section of the code'

(E)Open:Abuildingorstructuresubjecttotheprovisionsofthissectionshallbe
deemed to bei;o"pen" if any one or more exterior doors other than a storm door is

brot<en, op"n-"ni, o, ctoseb but, without a properly.functioning lock to secure it' or

ifoneormorewindowsisbrokenornotcapableofbeinglockedandsecuredfrom
intrusion, or any combination of the same'

(F) Owner: An owner of the freehold of the premises or any lesser estate therein' a

mortgagee, 
"-uenoee-in-possession, 

assignee of rents, receiver, executor, trustee'

lessee, agent or any other person, iirm o-r corporation.that is directly or indirectly

in control or a ouirding'troj."t to ihe provisions of this section, and as set forth

below.

(G) Vacant: A building or structure shall be deemed to be vacant if no person or

persons 
".d;ld;U;rently 

conducts a lawfully licensed business' or lawfully

resides or tives'in 
"nv 

patt of the building as the legal.or equitable owne(s) or

tenant-occupant(s), or owner-occupantl, or tenant(s) on a permanent,

nontransient basis'

(2)Applicability.Therequiremenlgojthis.,sectionshaltbeapplicabletoeachownerofany
building tfrat is noiiiw"iiin! it"t.t'all.have been vacanl for more than 45 consecutive

days and to ea"i1-oiunei Jr resiOential property consisting of one or more vacant

dwellings ttrat snait i"u" n""n vacant formore tiran 45 conlecutive days' Each such

owner stratt cause io be filed a notarized registration statement, which shall include the

street addre., 
"nJ ["t."r-*tOLr ot eain such vacant building' the names and

Page 23



addtesses of all owners, as hereinafter described, and any other information deemed

necessary by the DLl. The registration fee(s) as required by subsection (bX3) of this

section shat[ Ue billed by the DLI and shall be paid by January 1 of each year. For

purposes of this section, the following shall also be applicable:

(A) lf the owner is a corporation, the registration statement shall provide the names

and residence addresses of all officers and directors of the corporation and shall

be accompanied by a copy of the most recent annual franchise tax report filed with

the secretary of state;

(B) lf an estate, the name and business address of the executor of the estate;

(C) lf a trust, the name and address of all trustees, grantors, and beneficiaries;

(D) lf a partnership, the names and residence addresses of all partners with an interest

of ten Percent or greater;

(E) lf any other form of unincorporated association, the names and residence

addresses of all principals with an interest of ten percent or greater;

(F) lf an individual person, the name and residence address of that individual person.

(3) Registration statement and fees; locat agent.lf none of the persons listed, as above, is

snown at an address within the state, the registration statement also shall provide the

name and address of a person who resides within the state and who is authorized to

accept service of process on behalf of the owners and who shall be designated 9s a

responsible, local party or agent, both for purposes of notification in the event of an

emergency affecting the public health, safety or welfare and for purposes of service of

any and ail notices or registration statements as herein authorized and in connection

herewith. Registration shall be required for all vacant buildings, whether vacant..and

Secure, vacant and open, vacant and boarded, or occupancy ready and shall be

required whenever any building has remained vacant for 45 consecutive days or more.

ln no instance shall the registration of a vacant building and the payment of registration

fees be construed to exonerate the owner, agent or responsible party from responsibility

for compliance with any other building code or housing code requirement. One

registration statement may be filed to include all vacant buildings of the owner so

relistering. The owner of the vacant property as of November 1 of each calendar year

snitt ne iesponsible for the payment of the non-refundable registration fee, except

buildings deemed "occupancy ready" by the DLI and actively for sale or lease shall be

exempi from imposition of the annual registration fee. However, buildings deemed
,,occupancy ready" by the DLI shall only be exempt from imposition of the annual

registiation fee for no more than 2 consecutive billing cycles. Except as provided. in

su"bsection (bX3XA) below, said fee shall be billed by the DLI and based on the duration

of the vacancy as determined by the following scale:

(i.) No fee for properties that are vacant for less than one year;

(ii.) $S00.00 for properties that are vacant for at least one year but less than two years;

(iii.) $1,000.00 for properties that are vacant for at least two years but less than three

years;

(iv.) $2,000.00 for properties that are vacant for at least three years but less than five

years;

(v.) $3,S00.00 for properties that are vacant for at least five years but less than ten

years; and

(vi.) $5,000.00 for properties that are vacant for at least ten years, plus an additional

$500.00 for each year in excess of ten years'

Page 24



(c)

(A) The vacant registration fee billed to a housing provider meeting the criteria for

non-prorii'oig-;nizations as defined by Secti91. 501(c)(3) of the lnternal

Revenue-Coie anO who receives a vacant building directly from the city or

*,no ,""liu"r prUri. funds from the city for the acquisition, rehabilitation or

reoeveto-pm-enl oi a vacant building snall not be based on the duration of the

u"."n"y [iiJitt ir'" non-profit nouling provider receiving the vacant building

from the;iil ; receivinj the funds from the city, but rather from the time it

received in6 vacant ouii-ding or funds from the city. This provision shall be

retroactive to MaY 1, 2003'

(4) Appeal rights. The ownel shall have the right to appeal the.imposition of the registration

fees to tne licenses'anJ tnspection Reviiw goaio, upon filing an application in writing

with the applicaote $so.oo non-t"fundable filing fee to the Department of Licenses and

lnspections no r"i"iit.'an 30 calendar days aftlr the date.of.the billing statement' on

appeal, tne ownei sn"tt Out1. the burden of providing satisfactory objective proof of

obfupan"y, as defined in 125'0(bX1XC)'

(5) one time waiver of registration fega A one-time waiver of the registration fee' or an

extension ot a waiveifor up to 12 months form the date of the billing statement

immediately totnwffine wtiu.i t"v be granted by the Commissioner of Licenses and

lnspections upon'uipiit"tion oi.tne'owrier and upon review and advice of the law

department, witninTdcarenoar oays from the date of the bill for the registration fee, if

the owner

(i.) Demonstrate with satisfactory proof that he/she is in the process of demolition'

rehabilitation, or off'"l. substahtial repair of the vacant building; and

(ii.) objectively demonstrates the anticipated length of time for the demolition'

rehabilitation, or other substantial repair of the vacant building; or

(iii.) Provides satisfactory proof that he/she was actively attempting to sell or lease the

property during the vacancy period'

(6)Four-yearwaiver'Uponapplicationbytheownerandsatisfactionofsubsection(b)(5)
above, the commissioner may, upon, advice and review of the law department, grant a

onetime tou, y""iwuiver of ine registration fee, or an extension of a waiver for up to

12 months trom tne-oate of the billing statement immediately following the w_aiver, if the

owner meets the criteria for non-profit ortanizations.as defined by Section q91!t)!31."f

the lnternal neuen-u" cooe. witn regaro t6 an extension of a waiver only, the time period

of the extension sriarr commence from the date of the billing statement (November 1 of

the applicabf. ."f"nO"iy"ar) and, in no event, shallthe extension exceed 12 months'

An e*tbntion of a waiver shall only be granted once'

(7\ Delinquent registration fees as a lien. After the owner is given notice of the amount of
\ ' 'r il; r"Gi;;ii; f;;;;, except for those owners that have properlv perfected an appeal

pursuant to suuse"tion'tol tal above, and the owner fails io pay the amount due, said

amount snal coniiiiute a obot due and owing to the city, and the city may commence

a civil action to collect such the unpaid debt'

Dutytoamendregistrationstatement.lfthestatusoftheregistrationinformationchanges
during the course .t ".v'l;".o"lil"l, 

it is the responsibility of the owner, responsible party

or agent for the ,u*" ib lontact ttre department ol licensei and inspections within 30 days

of the occurrence of ;;;;h;;I; and advise the department in writing of those changes'

Exceptions.Thissectionshallnotapplytoanyb.uildingqyn"gbytheUnitedStates,the
state, the city, nor to 

"nV 
of in"il t"tfjeciiue agencies or political subdivisions'(d)

(e) Violations; Penalties
of an owner acting on behalf
required to be Paid Pursuant(1) Thefailureorrefusalforanyreasonofanyowner,oragent

oiin"l**i, to register a vicant building or to pay any fees

Page 25



to the provisions of this section, within 30 days after they become due, shall constitute

, uioi"iion punishable upon conviction thereof by a fine in the amount of not less than

$100.00 nor more than $500.00 for each failure or refusal to register, or for each failure

or refusal to pay a required vacant building fee, as applicable. ln such cases, whenever

tne-minimum fine of'$100.00 is imposed, it shall not be subject to suspension or

reduction for anY reason'

Section {21.0 WorkmanshiP

12{.1 General: All work shall be conducted installed and completed in a safe, workmanlike and

acceptable manner so as to secure the results intended by this code.

CHAPTER 2 DEFINITIONS

section 202 Definitions is amended by adding the following definitions and shall read as follows:

section 202.0. Occupied: A building or structure shall be deemed to be occupied if one or more

p""on, actually r"riJli or tive in the Suilding as the lega.l or.equitable owner/occupant(s) or tenant(s)

on a perman"nt, nonir"nsient basis, or if one or more individuals, firms, corporations, partnerships, or

other entities 
".trrf 

iV op"rates an ongoing duly licensed business, whether as owner or tenant' in the

subject building or shucture. ror purposis otinis code, evidence offered to prove that a building is

occupied ,"y in"1uJ", oui .nuil n,it oe timiteo to, the regular receipt of delivery of regular mail through

the U.S. postal S"rib";'pi"oi of continual telephone,-electric, gas, heating, water and sewer, and

cable television suoscriner services; the production of a current limitation of occupancy notification

application prr"u"ntio tnii section by the department of licenses and inspections; a valid city business

license; or the most recent, federal, state, or city income tax statements indicating that the subject

property is an occupied building for residential or nonresidential purposes'

vacant: A building or structure shall be deemed to be vacant if no person or persons actually currently

resides or lives inin" OuifOing as the legalor equitable owner/occupant(s) ortenant(s) on a permanent,

nontransient oasis,. oi it noi" of any'individubls, firms, corporations, partnerships, or other entities

actually operates-an ongoing duly iicensed business, whether as owner or tenant, in the subject

building or structure,

Mobile Unit: Mobile unit or home are not permitted unless being used for temporary facility

CHAPTER 4 SPECIAL DETAILED REQUIREMENTS BASED ON USE AND

OCCUPANCY

SEcTtoN 406 MoroR-VEHIGLE-RELATED occuPANclES is amended by adding new subsection

Stction 406.9 Parking Lots and shall read as follows;

section 406.9. Parking lots. Parking lots shall comply with the following:

section 406.9.1. Gurb cuts. Parking lots shall be arranged so as to afford ready means.of

entrance and exit at sidewalk level. dpecial permits for all curb cuts shall be secured from the

appropriate city department or state agency'

Section 406.9.2. Lanes and parking spaces. Access-lanes that are not less than 12 feet (3658

mm) each in *iOin rf,r"f l be provided f6r each lane of traffic for motor vehicles' Each parking space

shal be noir"5 tnin eighifeet (2348 mm) by 18 feet (5480 mm) in dimensions for each motor

vehicle, ,nr"s. ot-ne*isj specified or authoriied by a provision of the wilmington city Code'

section 406.9.3. protection of adjoining property. A substantial bumper of masonry, steel or

heavy timoei 
"no 

of suitabte size and srrJp6 tor the purpose shall be placed along all lot lines in

order to pr"t";i structures and property abutting or adjoining the parking lot'

Page 26



Section 406.9.4. Surface and drainage. Parking lots s.hall be graded with rolled or compacted

cinders, gr"u"l'oi oini1" 
"pproued 

nona-bsorbent riaterials to prevent the raising of dust and shall

be maintainel.o "r1" 
pi.vent drainage onto adjoining property, adjacent sidewalk, or public

right of waY.

section 406.9.5. Electric illumination. Electric light wiring shall be provided tofurnish adequate

iltumination "i;ri""*;t; 
and lanes is required_by-the administrative authorities for street lighting'

but such iltumination shalt be not less ilran o.is lumen per square foot (2'69 lumens/m2) of

Parking area.

SEcTloN420GRoUPSl.l,R-{,R-2,R.3isamendedshallreadasfollows:
** section 420.4 Automatic sprinkter system. Group. R occupancies shall.be equipped throughout

with an automatic rprinr.Er .vitem in a-icordance wiih section 903.2'8 with the exception of-R-3

occupancies, oetacnla ano .Lh'ri-o"t"clred one and two family dwellings only, which are exempt from

this requirement. Oioup f-f occupancies shall be equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler

system in accorcance wittr section g03.2.6. Quick-re'sponse or residential automatic sprinklers shall

be installed in accordance with Section 903'3'2'

CHAPTERSGENERALBUILDINGHEIGHTSANDAREAS

section s0r Generar is amended by adding new subsection section 50i.2 and shall read as follows:

501.2 General

Chapter 5 is amended by deleting ?ry aN.all references to,.SB..construction. Type.,5B''

construction ir ;;i p;;ritieo in trr6 city of wilmington, Except for section 506.4 Accessory

Buildings. stiucturei for motor vehicle pirking and uied car sales lots not exceeding 100 square

feet when no .tot"t than 6 feet minimum from any building line'

SECTION 504 BUILDING HEIGHT AND NUMBER OF STORIES:

section 504.3 Height in Feet is amended and sharr read as foilows: The maximum height, in feet' of a

OuiiOing, shall not exceed the limits specified in Table 504'3'

Exception: Towers, steeples and other roof structures shall be constructed of materials consistent

with the required type of construction of the building except where other construction is permitted

by Section $\6.i.\-. tn apptying tire-provisions. oi t19 basic code governing height limits' the

following appurtenance struiturei snarr?,o1 be included in the height of the building: Roof tanks and

their supports, ventilating, air conditioning ano similar building service equipment, roof structures

other than pentn-uses oi chimneys anJ p"arapet walls not exceeding four feet in height, unless the

aggregate 
"ru" 

ot-"u.r,-structurei, inctuoing penthouses, exceeds onethird of the area of the roof

oiine-nuitoing upon which they are built'

Section504BuildingHeightAndNumberofStoriesisamendedbyaddingnewsubsectionsSection
;04.;.i; iection sotr-e.t.1,504'1'1'2 and shall read as follows:

SectionS04,4.loneandTwoFamilyDweltings.Prgyide!thattheyareconstructedinaccordance
with the applicable provisions of the lnternalionir euiloing code 2018, particularly in connection with

fire-protection requirements, for protecteJ framJ construclion, and the amendments in this section'

section 504.4.1.1. one-famity detached dwellings and one-family semi-detached dwellings' not

exceeding tniee stories in heilht, rniri u" 
"t "tel 

of protected frame construction (Type 5A)' All

structural elements shall meet the requirements of stiength and rigidity as specified in chapter 16

and 23, ".i"".rii*iion ", 
risteo inTaui"r oor and od2 of the international Building code' ln

one-family ,"r"i,i"i"ineo owettings, *"rri o"t*een the housing units shall be two-hour party

Page27



walls and shall meet the requirements of the 2018 lnternational Residential Code and the 2018

lnternational Building Gode.

Section 504.4.1.2. Rowhouses or townhouses, not exceeding ten houses in number or three

stories in height, shall be constructed of protected frame construction (Type 5A). Allstructural

elements shajl meet the requirements of strength and rigidity specified in C_hapters 16 and 23,

and construction as listed in Tables 601 and 602 of the lnternational Building Code.. All party

walls between housing units shall be two-hour pariy walls and shall meet the requirements of the

2018 lnternational Residentialcode and the 2018 IBC . basie€€d€'.

SECTION s06 BUILDING AREA is amended with new subsections Section 506.4, 506.5, and 506.6

shall read as follows:

Section 506.4 Accessory buildings. Accessory buildings type 5B with motor vehicle parking lots and

used car sales lots may b-e erectedlf frame construction if not exceeding 100 square feet in area and

ien feet in height, when located not less than six feet from lot lines or any building. Any building

exceeding 1001quare feet must be installed with a permanent foundation'

Section 506.5 Bay Windows. Bay or oriel windows shall be built of protected frame construction

FV-pe S4; on residlntial structures of R-3 (One and Two Fa.mily Dwellings). Such windows shall not

lxc'eea 14 feet in length and not project beyond the exterior wall line more than three feet' Such

windows shall not be n'earer than thieeieet from party lot lines, nor shall any two such windows on the

same story be built nearer than five feet to each other'

CHAPTER 6 TYPES OF CONSTRUCTION

sEcTloN 602. CONSTRUCTTON CLASSIFICATION is amended by adding new subsection 602.5.1

and shall read as follows:

602.s.i Type 5B construction is prohibited in the City of Wilmington (including any/all references in

Tables 503, 601, and 602)'

CHAPTER 9 FIRE PROTECTION SYSTEMS

sEcTloN 903.2.8 Group R is amended and shall read as follows:

*** section g03.2.g Group R. An aufomatic sprinklersystem installed in accordance with section

g03.3 shall ne proviOeO throughout all buildings with a Group R fire area, except Group R-3 one and

two family, detached and semi-detached buildings, with a separate means of egress.

Automatic Sprinkler system. Group R-3 occupancies, defined and regulated by the lnternational

Residential code as detached one and two family dwellings and townhouses not more than three

stories above graOe piane in height with a separaie means of egress per dwelling, are exempt from

ihe requirem"nt to inlt"l an auto-matic fire spiinkler ly9tem Group R-1, R-2, R-3, R-4 dwelling units

located within and a part of mixed use commercial buildings and regulated by the lnternational Building

code are not exempted from the Group R sprinkler requirement.

Congregate living facilities, such as boarding houses, lodging houses,. care facilities, dormitories,

fraternities, .ororiti"., apartment houses of two or more units classified as R-3 and mixed use

occupancy ouiroingsioniaining 
"ny 

Group R with any other occupancy Use are not exempted from

the automatic sprinkler requirement'

sections 903.2.8.1, 903.2,8.2, 903.2.8.3, 903.2.8.4 are deleted in their entirety, and replaced with

the following Section sgi2.g.i, 903.2.8.1 Group R-3 or R4 congregate residences' An automatic

Page 28



sprinklersysteminstalledinaccordancewithSectiong03'3'1.2(l3RSystem)shallbepermittedin
Group R-3, including on" tnJ two family dwellings) and R-4 congregate residences with 16 or fewer

CHAPTER 10 MEANS OF EGRESS

TABLE 1004.5 AND SECTION {004.8 Occupant Load Galculation in Business Use Areas

sEciloN 1004.g (Referencing Tabre 1004.5 ,,Goncentrated Business Use Areas" noted, "see

"""ti"" 
1004.8") is amended and shall read as follows:

Sectiont004.3concentratedBusinessUseAreas.TheConcentratedBusinessUse
calcutation ,";;f,g-;ilii;-toM; construction Buitdings on!y, or, those Existing Buitdings that

meet all tne reiuirenients of chapter 10, "Means of Egress" for the increased occupant load

requested. rn,Jo."rp".i toao taitor for ConcentratedBusiness shall be applied to Telephone

call Centers, ir;id Floor., Electronic Data Processing centers and similar business use areas,

with a higher j".riiv 
"t 

occu'pants than would normally be expected in the iypical "Business

Areas,, fisteO in faOi" tOO+.S at a 150 Gross Load FaCtor. Where approved by the Building

official, tn" 
".rri"ni 

roao .r'itibe the Actual occupant Load as verified by a submitted and

approved turniiu[-ravout, ort not lesi than one occupant per 50 square feet of gross occupiable

floor space. in. *Ni.r* width, in inches, of all Means of Egress components' Accessibility

requirement, 
"nd 

ditensions must comply wilh tn9 leguilements 
of chapters 10 and 1 1 of the

201g lnternational Building code, tne-rcbinrust A117.1-2017 standards for Accessibility and all

applicable requirement" oi the code for the proposed construction.

SECTION10{5-4GUARDS,isamendedandshallreadasfollows:

section 1015.4 opening Limitations. Required guards shall not have openings which allow passage

of a sphere a tn.ri"r'iidz mm) in diameter tronittre walking surface to the required guard height'

Required guarosir,art not be constructeo with horizontal rails or other ornamental patterns that results

in a ladder etfect in Oro'p n-f , R-2' R-3' R-4' E' l-2 and Type l-4 occupancies'

residents.

Exceptions:

1. From a height of 36 inches (914 mm) to 42 inches (1067 mm), guards shall not have

openings tliat allow passage of a sphere 4'lu inches (111 mm) in diameter'

2. The triangular openings at the open-sides of a stair, formed by the riser, tread and

bottom rail shatt noi 
"fio* 

passage of a sphere 6 inches (152 mm) in diameter'

3. At elevated walking surfaces for access to and use of electrical' mechanical or

plumbing systems o"r equipme n!, gu.?rds shall not have openings that allow passage

bt a spnere 21 inches (533 mm) in diameter'

4. ln areas that are not open to the pubtic within occupancies in Group l-3' F' H or s'

and for atternating'-tie{idevres ino ships tadders, guards shall not have openings

that allow passagL of a sphere 21 inches (533 mm) in diameter'

5. ln assembly ,".iing areas, guards required at.the end of als/es in accordance with

section 1o2g.17. inatt not have openings that gtlgw na.slage of a gqletgj inches

(102 mm) in Oiametli'rpi"-lf1"ightbf 26 inches (660 mm)' From a heightof 26 inches

(660 mm) to +z in-cn'es iiooT ri]) ruou" the adjacent walking surfaces, guarics shall

not have openings that allow passage of a sphere 8 inches (203 mm) in diameter'

6. Within individuaidwe tting unitsand l/eeprng unifs in Group R-2 and R-3 occupancies'

guardson the d;;il;1 ;i-;fq."" snafr n6t have openings that allow passage of a

Ipfrere 4"lu(111 mm) inches in diameter'

Page 29



1

2

sEcTtoN {030.{ EMERGENCY ESCAPE AND RESCUE, Section 1030.1 has been modified to delete

Ei""ption r. section 1030.1 is amended and shall read as follows:

1030.1General.

3.2. Two means ofegress

1030.1.1 Operational constraints and opening control devices'

ln addition to the means of egress required by this chapter, emergency escape and rescue opentngs

shall be provided in the following occupancies:

Group R-2 occupancies located in stories with only one exif or access to only one exlf as permitted

by Tabies 1006.3'3(1) and 1006'3'3(2)'

GrouP R-3 and R-4 occuPancies'

Basements and sleeping rooms below the fourth story above grade p/ane shall have not fewer

than one exterior ,;;;;;;;v """rp" 
and rescue opening in accordance with this section. where

basements contain onutt more st6eping rooms, emergency escape and rescue openings shall be

required in each sreepin!'roo* nuiih.alt-not be requirJd in adjoining areas of the basemenf' such

openings shail open oli"Jtrv inio a public way ot to a yard or courtthat opens to a public way.

Exceptions:

1. Emergency escape and rescue openings are not.required from basemenfs or sleeping rooms

that have an exit Oooi or exif access door thit opens directly into a public way or to a yard' coufi or

exterior exit balcony that opens to a public way'

z. Basemenfs without habitabre spaces and having not more than 200 square feet (18'6 m2) in floor

area shall not be required to have emergency escape and rescue openings'

3. Within individual dwettingand s/eepin g uiittin Groups R-2 and R-3, where the building is equipped

throughout with an iiloittit spriixter'iisfem installed in accordance with section 903'3'1'1,

iiog.i:r.2org03.3.1 .Z,steipingroomsinbasemenfssha[notberequiredtohaveemergencyescape
ind rescue openings provideOinat the basement has one of the following:

3.1' one ,,"n,of egress and one emergency escape and rescue opening.

Emergency escape and rescue openingsshall be operational from inside the room without the use of

keys or toots. windo*:il;;rg-*"troi ievices comprying with ASTM F2090 shail be permitted for use

onwindowsserving".a'eq,.iredemergencyescapeandrescueopening.

Chapter 30: ELEVATORS AND CONVEYING SYSTEMS

SECTION 3OO1

GENERAI,

3001.6. periodic tests. periodic tests shall be made by the owner's insurance company or its

authorized agent or ov an auir-.'orized elevator inspector agency approved by the code official, and

shall be made at the expense and responsi-oiiitv ,jt the owier..where such tests are not made by the

code official, the authorized insuran." .otpiny, its agent.or the inspection agency shall submit a

detaired, written 
'""port'ot 

tn" test and its reluitsio thicode officiar, on forms approved by the code

officiar, not more ffran s-o iav, torro*ing tne 
"ompreiion 

or such.tests. This subsection shall not apply

to elevators in structurJ! N-.1r" group n-a lin-ri, which are not accessed by the general public' lt

Page 30



shall be the sole responsibility of the owner to ensure the safety of operation of its elevating
equipment.

3001.7. Owner's proof of inspections and tests. Every building owner or his legal agent shall submit
a verified or certified copy of proof of all inspections and tests and maintenance tests of any and all

elevators and equipment as required by this article at such times and in such manner as provided in

this article. No certificate of registration shall be issued by the code official to any owner or his legal

agent of the building until and unless such verified or certified copy of proof of inspections and tests

and maintenance tests as provided herein shall have been submitted to and accepted by the code

official.

3001.8, Penalties for violation. Any owner or his legal agent of any building who fails to comply with

section 3001.5 of this Chapter shall be deemed guilty of a misdemeanor and punishable as provided

in section 116.4. Each day that a violation continues shall be deemed a separate offense.

3001 .g. After the service of such notice, it shall be the duty of the owner to proceed within the time

allowed to make such repairs or changes as are necessary to place the equipment in a safe

condition; and it shall be unlawful to operate such equipment after the date stated in the notice

unless such recommended repairs or changes have been made and the equipment and any repairs

or changes have been inspected and tested by the owner or his insurance company or its authorized

agent or an authorized elevator inspection agency and the equipment has been certified to the code
official as being in compliance with the provisions of this article and such certification has been

accepted and approved by the code official or an extension of time has been secured from him in

writing

3001.10. Sealing of unsafe equioment. The owner of the building in which the equipment is located

or his legal agent shall be responsible for the maintenance and safe operation of all equipment

covered by this article and shall be responsible for any.unsafe condition of any device or equipment

including any condition rendering such device or equipment totally unsafe for operation covered by

this artiCle. lf the insurance company or its authorized agent or any authorized elevator inspection

agency, when it has inspected or tested any such equipment or device in accordance with the
piovisions of this article, finds in its opinion a case of emergency or that any such device or
equipment is in a condition to render it unsafe for operation, the insurance company or its agent or

an authorized elevator inspection agency shall have the authority to seal out the service of any such

device or equipment covered by this Chapter.

3001.11. Notice of sealing out of service. Before sealing any device out of service, the insurance

company or tts authorized agent or the authorized elevator inspection agency, except in case of

emergency, shall serve written notice upon the building owner or lessee and upon the code official

stating intention to seal equipment out of service and the reasons therefor. The cefiificate of
registiation of such equipment or device shall be immediately revoked.

3001 .12. Ito remove seal. Any device sealed out of service by the owner's or legal agent's
or any authorized elevator inspection agency shall be
the reason for such sealing, and any defacing or removal
removal of the seal without approval of the code official,

insurance company or its authorized agent
plainly marked with a sign or tag indicating
of the sign or tag, or any tampering with or
shall constitute a violation of this Chapter'

3001 .13. Accidents reported and recorded. The owner of the building shall immediately notify the

code off'cial of every accident involving personal injury or damage to apparatus on or about or in

connection with any equipment covered by this article, and shall assist the code official's

investigation of such an accident. When an accident involves the failure, breakage, damage or

Page 31



destruction of any part of the apparatus or mechanism, it shail be unrawfur to use such device until

after an examination nv inJ "*iti" 
oi nir regar agent's insurance company or its authorized agent

or an authorized elevator inspection agency 
-ot 

tne equipmentfor continued use, submittal of a

verified or certified ."py; J"h Lxamlnatidn and approvar of the equipment for continued use by the

insurance company or its agent or an authorized elevator inspection agency to the code official' and

issuance by the cooe otticia"t of a certificate of registration as required by the provision of this article'

The owner,s or his legal agent's insurance compiny or its 
-agent 

or an authorized elevator inspection

agency shall make , 'p;"pt ;-r*ination into the c-ause of the accident and shall file a certified or

verified copy of a turr lnd Jomprete report thereof with the code officiar. such records sharl be open

for public inipection at all reasonable hours'

3001.14. Registration of exigtino eguipment, The persons, associations or corporations responsible

fortheinstalling"naffiistingelevator,escalator,equipmentordevicecovered
by this articre snarr wiinin a periJo of six months ifter the adoption of the basic code, register with

the code official eacn-sucn existing elevator, escalator, equipment or device' such registration shall

be made on a form to 6e turnisrreo- ny t,e code official giving type of equipment' name of

manufacturer, its location and purpose, identification, serial number as provided by section 3004'2

anJ sucn other information as required on the form'

CHA,PTER 33: SAFEGUARDS DURING CONSTRUGTION

sEcToN 3303 DEMOLITON is amended by addin_g n_ewsubsections seetion 3303.8, Section 3303'9'

section g30g.i0, s"clion jros.rr, secti6n 330i.12, section 3303.13, section 3303'14, section

3303.14.1, Section eloi.ia.i, 
-s"ciion 

lcog.t+.g, Section 3303.14'4, section 3303.{4.5, section

3303.{s, Section 3303.i6, Section 3303.17;-s;ction sgos.t7.1, Section 3303.18, Section 3303'18 and

shall read as follows:

SECTION 3303. DEMOLITION

SECTION 3303. DEMOLITION

Section3303.3.Noticetooccupantsofnearbypropertiespriortoissuanceofdemolition
Permit.

A. The code otficial, prior to issuance of any demolition permit under this chapter, except

toi"r"rg"n"t demolitions as set forth below, shall require evidence of notice by the

"ppi.rnitoiZ 
permit for demolition to occupants of nearby properties for the purpose

of addressing concerns with ingress, egress, and interference with their occupancy' as

,.,.'"v;;;;i6p"t"o to oe 
""usLo 

oy nling or.falling debris, noise, and dust occurring

6*{.11n" oianned oemorittn. Such notiie shall b-e in accordance with the following

minimum requirements:

1. Such notice shall be provided to such occupants, by.and at the expense of the

appticant for the O"-*t-fition-p"ltr\t, at least'seven (Z; Oays prior to the date of

issuance of the oemolition peimit. The notice should be sentto the property owners.

via certified mait ano documentation must be provided .to the Department of

Licenses ano tnspeciLns prior to the issuance of the demolition permit' occupants

who should re"eive sucn notice shall include, at a minimum, those occupants of

buildings that are foc#O on the same block-face as the proposed demolition site'

2. The notice required by this section shall. include, at a minimum' the demolition

p"-iijppri.arit'" pr"nioi maintaining vehicular and pedestrian ingress and egress

il;;;di prop"rtieJ,'1.re "*p".t"o 
luration of the demolition operations, noise,

Page 32



dust, erosion control, and the plan, including the expected duration of time, for the
removaland disposition of rubble resulting from the demolition.

B. For emergency demolitions only, the requirement of this subsection can be satisfied by
hand-delivered written notice to the neighboring occupants, as described above, prior
to the actual commencement of demolition work, further provided that notice may be
waived wherever and whenever there is no person present to receive the attempted
hand-delivered written notice.

C. Before the Department of Licenses & lnspections issues a permit for demolition,
drawings shall be submitted by a licensed structural engineer or architect, indicating
that the demolition will leave a solid and secure foundation/footer upon which the
remaining party wall will rest. A detailed drawing of the party wall must be submitted to
the Department of Licenses and lnspections prior to the insurance of the final demolition
permit.

D. The Department of Licenses and lnspections shall be authorized to use such forms and
procedures it may deem necessary in order to administer the provisions of this
subsection.

Section 3303.9. Protection of Party Walls during Demolition.

Any pariy wall exposed by the demolition of any building or other structure shall be properly
protected and maintained in a safe and secure manner.

Section 3303.1 0. TreatmenUSafety Party Wa I ls.

Whenever any building or other structure is altered, changed, razed or demolished so as to
expose any party wall which forms a part of the building or other structure being altered,
changed, razed or demolished, the owner of the building or other structure upon which any
of these operations are being performed shall repair and restore all flashing on any adjoining
property which has been broken or damaged during any such operations, and shall remove
any and all plaster from the exposed side of any such party wall if it complies with the
requirements of this code pertaining to walls of new buildings,

Section 3303.11. Treatment of Unsafe Party Walls.

(a) lf any building or structure enclosed on one or more sides with a party wall is wholly or
partially removed, razed or demolished, and any party wall left standing and exposed
is for any reason unsafe, the owner of the building being removed, razed or demolished
shall remove any portion of all of such party walls deemed unsafe by the building official,
reconstruct and do all other necessary work to enclose properly the building left

standing. However, if the owner of the building left standing refuses to allow the

adjoining owner access to his premises to do any work in connection with such party

wall, or if such owner elects to remove, taze or demolish such party wall and erect a
new wall on his own property, it becomes the responsibility of the owner of the building

left standing to remove such party wall and perform all other work as may be necessary

to eliminate any and all unsafe conditions.

(b) lf any adjoining property owner refuses to allow the owner of a building being removed,

razed or demolished access to his premises and fails to remove, raze or demolish any

unsafe or dangerous party wall as directed by the code official, the code official shall
proceed as provided in Section 115.1

Section 3303.12. Nonconforming party walls.

lf any building or other structure which is enclosed on one or more sides with a party wall or
party walls is razed or demolished, and any party walls are left standing and exposed with

ihicknesses that do not meet the requirements of the code for party wall construction and,

Page 33



as such, is deemed structurally unsafe and dangerous by.the code otficial, the standing and

"*por"d 
party watts shall be made conforming o1safe and secure in full compliance with this

code.

Section 3303.13. Demolition Construction requirements'

Nonconforming party walls of insufficient thickness left standing and exposed as a result of

the demolition of in6 adjoining building, and deemed structuratly unsafe and dangerous by

the code otficiat, maysnitt be made safe and Secure as follows:

(a) A solid brick lining not less than eight inches (8") in thickness may be constructed

on the ext"rior to"form a combined thickness with the old wall of not less than four

inches (4") more than the thickness required for a conforming wall.

(b) The brick lining shall be supported on proper foundations and thoroughly anchored

to tne old nriif watt with suitable anchors placed two feet apart, and properly

tasteneO or Oriven into the old wall in rows, alternatively, vertically and horizontally

witn eactr otner, ttre otd wall being first cleaned of plaster and other coatings where

any lining is to be built against the same'

(c) The demotition contractor will be responsible for the condition of the site to include

Oairy cfeanlng of ail debris from any sidewalks, roadways, and/or adjacent

ProPerties'

Section 3303.14. Demolition of buildings'

Section 3303.14.1' Prior to demolition'

Before actual demolition is started (where practicable), all adjoining foundation walls

are to be rrt.rprooi"O. Concrete basement iloors are to removed completely to provide

poiitiu" Orainage. The sewer.lines are to be cut, stutfed with rags or paper for.at least

ifirlJ teet tg'fjnO cappeO with concrete. This is to be checked and approved by the

code official prior to demolition'

Section 3303.14.2' Safeguards to be erected'

Whenever a building or structure more than two stories or 25 feet In height above the

curb line is to be demolished, the person doing such work shall erect and maintain

suitabte anO rrnitantal safeguards satisfactory [o tfe code official during the period of

demotition. Th; pr"G;d sai'eguarcls shall be !ubmitted to the building code official for

review and approval prior to construction'

Section 3303.14.3. Procedure to be followed'

Unless otherwise authorized by the code official, in demolition of any building, one story

at a time 
"f','ufiO" 

completely removed. All material shall be lowered to the ground

immediatety'Jp"" oiri,r"t"m"nt No wall, chimney or otherconstruction shall be allowed

to fa1 en r!il" on dn upper ftoor. Bulky materiats such as beams and columns shall

ne towereoliJ not rrro,lubo to fall. Materials to be removed shall be properly wet to

control the dust incident to its removal. The site shall be kept clean during the entire

demolition process and/or construction'

Section 3303.14.4' Ghutes'

Unless otheruvise authorized by the code official, chutes for the removal of materials

and debrisln.fr-6" prouided in all such parts of demolition operalions.th-at are more

than 20 teeialove the point where the removal of materials is affected. Such chutes

Page 34



Section 3303.14.5. SPrinkling.

Chutes, floors, stainrvays and other places shall be sprinkled to keep down the dust.

section 3303.15. Remaining Party wall Gonstruction Requirements.

The following aspects of the demolition of an attached building shall be addressed in

accordance with this subsection:

Building plans shall be submitted to the Department of Licenses and lnspections for review

and approval.

1. The remaining party wall, after demolition, shall be rebuilt using brick.

2. Rigid insulation at a minimum of 1" shall be installed so as to guarantee a minimum

stJndard to assure occupants of the surviving building that there will be the same

level of comfort on a year-round basis, as there was prior to the demolition of the

adjoining building.

shall be completely enclosed. They shall not extend in an unbroken line for more than

25 feet, but shall be equipped at intervals of 25 feet or less with substantial stops to
prevent descending materials from attaining dangerous speeds. The bottom of each

chute shall be equifped with a gate or stop, with suitable means for closing or regulating

the flow of material.

The additional thickness in inches required to construct such a wall in accordance

with the foregoing requirements may be eased over to the owner of the existing

building, as well as all rights of access to the building wall and the right to use that

wall foi any reason that the owner of the surviving building may choose.

lf and when a new building is built on the site of the demolished building, and if

such new structure requirel the use of the common wall, the owner of the site of

the demolished building shall have the right to bring his or her property line back

to the same point tnaf it was prior to the demolition of the previously existing

building or structure and any easement as aforesaid.

3

4.

Section 3303.{6. ComPletion.

When any building has been demolished, the person doing such work shall immediately

clear the propefty?nd adjacent streets and alleys of all rubbish, refuse and loose material

resulting irom tnd demolition work. All excavations shall be filled level with adjoining grades

and snjtt contain clean fill material and topped off by six inches (6") of topsoil. Additionally,

the vacant lot must be enclosed by a fence minimum of four feet (4') high running along the

building line.

Section 3303.17. General Specifications for Demolition

PART 1 - GENERAL

f .01 RELATED DOCUMENTS

A. Department of Licenses and lnspections will perform an initial inspection prior to

the start of demolition to document the condition of the adjacent properties prior to

demolition. The Demolition Contractor shall call the Department of L & I for an

inspection prior to any work being performed'

1.02 DESCRIPTION OF WORK

A. Verify that all utilities have been disconnected and capped. Do NoT start

demolition work until utility disconnecting and sealing have been completed and

Page 35



verified in writing. USE sheet provided by the Department Licenses and

lnspections ("L&1").

B. Do not close, or obstruct streets, walks, walkways, or other adjacent occupied or
used facilities without permission from L&l and/or The Department of Public Works.

C. Seven (7) days prior to demolition of the property the demolition contractor is

required to send notices of the demolition to the neighbors.

D. Obtain demolition permit from L&|.

E. Erect and maintain all necessary barriers and/or safety fencing to prevent materials
from falling on or near personnel, and to prevent sections of the building being

demolished from falling into or on sections which are to remain.

F. Used water mist, temporary enclosure, and other suitable methods to limit spread
of dust and dirt.

G. Remove and transport debris to a certified disposal site in a manner that will
prevent spillage onto the area. No on-site burning or other disposal of materials

will be permitted.

H. Remove basement slab to prevent water retainage (as per City of Wilmington

code).

l. Upon completion of work, remove all tools, equipment and materials from the site

and leave the site clean.

J. Level ground so there is not any standing water ponds. Apply soil and seed as per

Code.

K. Erect fence as Per Code.

L. Contractor must obtain all required permits through L&1, Delaware Department of
Natural Resources and Environmental Gontrol ("DNREC"), and all other related

or required agencies.

1,03 SCHEDULE OF DEMOLITION WORK

Demolition requires following steps and procedures.

A. Disconnect and cap of utilities as per code.

B. Confirmed analysis and removal of Hazardous Materials as per DNREC

requirements.

C. Obtain demolition permit from the City of Wilmington.

D. Send notice of demolition seven (7) days prior to the demolition. (See Section

3303.8)

E. Call and schedule basement and inspection by L & I statf. (Section 3303.8)

F. Call and schedule inspection the capping of any existing sewer lines by inspection

by L & I staff. (Section 3303"14.1)'

G. Building foundation footer and supporting walls to a uniform depth as per code.

(Submittal of Drawing required).

H. Backfillarea must be filled in with clean filland top with 6" topsoil.

l. Sidewalk repair, landscape work, and fence perimeter.

J. Comply with City of Wilmington's demolition requirements.

K. Any area or materials damaged as a result of the demolition must be repaired

and/or replaced by the contractor.

Page 36



L. Upon completion of the demolition the contractor must obtained certificate of

compliance from the Department of Licenses and lnspections.

1.04 SUBMITTALS

Schedule: Submit proposed timetable of methods and operations of building demolition

to the Department of Licenses and lnspections for.review prior to start of work.

lnclude in ichedule coordination for shut-off, capping, and continuation of utility services

as required.

1.05 PARTIAL REMOVAL

Items of salvageabte value to owner may be removed from structures as work

piogi""."r. Saivaged items must be transported from site as they are removed.

btoiag" or sale of removed items on site will not be permitted.

1.06 EXPLOSIVES

Use of explosives will not be permitted, unless approved by the code official.

{.07 TRAFFIC AND SHORING

A. Conduct demolition operations and removal of debris to ensure minimum

interference with roads, streets, walks, and other adjacent occupied or used

facilities.

B. Do not close or obstruct streets, walks, or other occupied or used facilities without

permission from authorities having jurisdiction. Provide alternate routes around

closed or obstructed traffic ways if required by governing regulations'

c. provide interior and exterior shoring, bracing or support to prevent movement,

setttement or collapse of structures to be demolished and adjacent facilities to

remain.

1.09 DAMAGES

prompgy repair damages caused to adjacent facilities by demolition operations at no

cost to owner.

1.{O UTILITY SERVICE

A. Verify that all utilities have been disconnected and capped. DO NOT staft selective

Oemofition worf until utility disconnecting and sealing have been completed and

verified in writing. Use sheet provided by L&l'

B. The contractor is ultimately responsible for the disconnection of all utilities. The

contractor must use and complete a "Demolition Utility Sign otf and Permit".

PART 2 - EXECUTION

2.01 PERMITS, UTILITY SIGN OFF, NOTIFICATION AND HAZARDOUS ABATEMENT

A. The contractor must have a current City of Wilmington business license.

B. The contractor must apply and get a City of Wilmington demolition permit before

construction. The contractor muit use and complete a "Demolition Utility Sign off

anO permiti,and DNREC's "Notification of Demolition for Renovation" applications.

C. The Contractor will be responsible for the removal of ALL hazardous material in a

professionai r"nn"r with licensed certified contractors. City of Wilmington site

Page 37



representative shall receive written documentation verifying that site is free from
asbestos before demolition starts.

2.02 DEMOLITION

A. Pollution Controls: Use water sprinkling, temporary enclosures, and other suitable
methods to limit dust and dirt rising and scattering in air to lowest practical level.

You must use temporary fencing to secure site. You must use silk barrier or fabric
barrier to contain earth, moisture, and construction debris to the site. Comply with
governing regulations pertaining to environmental protection.

B. Do not use water when it may create hazardous or objectionable conditions such

as ice, flooding, and Pollution.

C. Clean adjacent structures and improvements of dust, dirt, and debris caused by

demolition operations, as directed by gove,rning authorities. Return adjacent areas
to condition existing prior to stad of work.

2.03 BUILDING DEMOLITION

Demolish buildings completely and remove from site. Use such methods as required to

complete work within limitations of governing regulations.

A. Proceed with demolition in systematic manner, from top of structure to ground.

Complete demolition work above each floor or tier before disturbing supporting

members on lower levels.

B. Demolish concrete and masonry in smallsections'

C. Remove structural framing members and lower to ground by hoists, derricks, or

other suitable methods.

D. Break up and remove concrete slabs-on-grade, unless otheruise shown to remain.

E. Saw cut all masonry walls that adjoin adjacent neighboring properties prior to
removing.

F. Locate demolition equipment throughout structure and remove materials so as to

not impose excessive loads to supporting walls, floors, or framing.

G. Drain and remove all tanks, boilers, heating systems, and piping, otf site to a
certified landfill.

H. lf there are any environmental materials found on site, it is the responsibility of the

contractor to notify the proper authorities and remove all asbestos in a professional

manner. Owner shall receive from regulatory authority written documentation
verifying that site is free from asbestos.

l. The demolition contractor will be responsible for the condition of the site including

daily cleaning of all debris from any sidewalks, roadways, and/or adjacent
properties.

2.03 BELOW.GRADE CONSTRUCTION

A. Demolish and remove allfoundation walls from the site EXGEPT support walls for

public sidewalks and bearing wall for adjoining structures. All foundation walls

along public sidewalks shall be a depth of not less than 18" below existing ground

surfice, or bottom of new foundation wall. Demolish and remove below-grade

wood, metal construction, and floor construction except public sidewalks on

grade.

B. Demolish and remove below-grade construction and concrete slabs and walks on

grade.

Page 38



2.04 FILLING BASEMENT AND VOIDS

Completely fill below-grade areas and voids resulting from demolition of structures.

A. Use satisfactory select materialto backfill, compact fillto 95% compaction, and seil
free from debris, trash,

frozen materials, roots and other organic matter.

B. Prior to placement of fill materials, ensure that areas to be filled are free of standing
water, frost, frozen material, trash and debris.

C. Place fill materials in horizontal layers not exceedingS" d in loose depth. Compact
to 95% each layer at optimum moisture content of fill material to a density equal to

the original adjacent ground, unless subsequent excavation for new work is

required.

D. After fill placement and compaction, grade surface to meet adjacent contours and

to provide flow to surface drainage structures.

E. The contractor must use clean compactable soil. NOT pulverize or crushed
debris. The top 6" of the finish grade shall be topsoil with grass seed and straw.

2.06 DISPOSAL OF DEMOLISHED MATERIALS

A. Remove from site ALL debris, rubbish, and other materials resulting from

demolition operations to a certified landfill'

B. Burning of removed materials from demolished structures will not be permitted on

site.

2.07 REMOVAL

Transport materials removed from demollshed structures and dispose of off-site to a
certified landfill.

2.08 FENGING

A. lnstall a permanent 4-foot high chain link fence with lockable gates, posts, post

caps, top rails, and secured with iies every three feet.

B. All posts must be mounted in concrete (6" gravel base and 24" deep, by 8"

diameter concrete).

C. lnstall fencing at required perimeter to secure lot (or lots) to prevent entry. Fencing

in historical district must be reviewed by the Department of Planning.

D. Fencing plan must be approved by the Department of Licenses and lnspections

Prior to installation,

Section 3303,18. Disclosure of environmental conditions applies to any interior or exterior
greater than 160 sq/ft.

Every owner or agent for the owner of a property for which a demolition permit application is

filed with the Department of Licenses and lnspections, shall provide full disclosure with such

demolition permit application of any pending environmental assessment, review,

remediation,-or voluntary compliance action that has been issued, ordered or approved by

the U.S. Environmentai Protection Agency, or by the Delaware Department of Natural

Resources and Environmental Control (DNREC). No demolition permit shall be issued or

approved until such full environmental disclosure has been filed with the department of

licenses and inspections to the satisfaction of the Commissioner of Licenses and

lnspections. The purpose and intent of this section is to prevent any property owner, builder,

contractor, developer or other person from obtaining a demolition permit from the city without

Page 39



fully disclosing and informing the city otficials of known environmental hazards on the siie

for which an Jpplication for a demolition permit has been made. 160 sq/ft

Section 3303.18.1 Disclosure of environmental conditions'

A. Every owner or agent for the owner of a property for which a demolition permit

applilation is fiteO-witn the Department of Licenses and lnspections, shall provide

tufi disclosure with such demolition permit application of any pending

environmental assessment, review, remediation, or voluntary compliance action

that has been issued, ordered or approved by the U.S. Environmental Protection

Agency, or by the Delaware Department of Natural Resources and Environmental

Control(DNREC).

B. No demolition permit shall be issued or approved until such full environmental

disclosure has been filed with the department of licenses and inspections to the

satisfaction of the commissioner of Licenses and lnspections.

C, The purpose and intent of this section is to prevent any property owner,-builder,

contractor, developer or other person from obtaining a demolition permit from the

city without fully disclosing and informing the city officials of known environmental

hazards on the site for which an application for a demolition permit has been made'

Section 3303.19 Abatement of public nuisances; governmental demolitions'

A. Nuisances;definitions.

1. ,,Nuisance" is defined as any condition of the land, or of the buildings erected

thereon, or of the trade or business conducted therein or thereon, or of unsightly

articles collected thereon or therein, or of obnoxious odors arising thereon, therein,

or there from, or any other condition that arises from the unreasonable, or unlawful

use by a person of his own property, real or pcrsonal, or from his improper conduct

that works as an injury to the right of the public, and produces material annoyance,

inconvenience, discomfort or hurt, or that is injurious to the health, or is indecent

or offensive to the senses, so as to interfere with a person's comfortable enjoyment

of life or property or so as to constitute a menace to the public health.

2. "Public nuisance building" is defined as any of the following:

a. Any building that, by reason of its condition, endangers public health, life,

lim'b, safety, or property, and is likely to cause harm, inconvenience, damage

or injurY to one or more Persons'

b. Any building that, by reason of continued vacancy and the lack of reasonable

maintenanCe, has deteriorated to the point that it is a blighting influence on

nearby properties, and poses a threat to the public health, safety, and welfare.

B. Emergency demotitions. When, in the opinion of the code official, a building is in such

condition that it constitutes a public nuisance building posing an imminent threat to the

public health, safety and weliare, such that it requires immedtate action and no less

drastic means or means short of substantial reconstruction are available on an

emergency basis, the code official may eliminate the.dangerous condition, demolish the

buitdiig, oi contract with other persons to do so. Prior to taking measures to eliminate

the dangerous condition, the code official will make reasonable efforts to notify the

record owner of the emergency condition, the intent to demolish the building or

otherwise to eliminate tne Jangerous condition, and the estimated timeframe within

which the dangerous condition must and shall be abated'

The department of Licenses and lnspections, in addition to invoking any other sanctions and

procedures, 1.n"y, *itn the approval of the law department, collect the costs incurred by the

Page 40



city from the owner of the building by lien, as authorized in 25 Del. C. S 4601 or as may

otherwise be authorized bY law.

C. Nonemergency demolitions. When in the opinion of the code official, a building is in a

condition such that it constitutes a public nuisance building, but does not pose an

imminent threat to the public health, safety and welfare such as would require

immediate action, the code official may eliminate the dangerous condition or demolish

the building, or contract with other persons to do so, there being no less drastic
measures that are reasonable and available'

D. Procedures: ln all instances of nonemergency demolitions of buildings as authorized
pursuant to the provisions of this section, the owner(s) of the building that is the object
of the nuisance abatement shall be provided with notice and an opportunity to be heard.

Written notice shall be provided by mailing of a certified letter, return receipt requested,

to the last known address of the record owner, owners or record lien holde(s) notifying

them of the address of the building to be demolished and including the following:

1. A list of specific conditions of the building that constitute violations of the building

code.

2. Notice that failure or refusal to correct the conditions within a specified period of
time following the mailing of the notice may lead to demolition of the building.

3. A concise statement that the owners or lien holders, as the case may be, have

appellate rights to an administrative hearing before the board of license and

inspection review wherein they may be represented by counsel, introduce

evidence, examine and cross-examine witnesses, and receive a decision in

writing, which decision shall include detailed findings of fact.

4. A concise statement of notice that, if the building is demolished, the city may lien

the property for the costs incurred by the city in accordance with the provisions of
25 Del, C. SS 4601 and 4602.

5. A concise statement of notice that the demolition notice and its receipt by the owner
or lien holder do not preclude criminal prosecution of the owner or lien holder.

6. Following the determination by the code officialthat a building is a public nuisance

building, but that it does not present an emergency, the city council by resolution

shall specifically direct the abatement of the nuisance.

E. ln any demolition, whether governmental or private, whether emergency 0r non-

emergency, there shall be landscaping of the affected lot by improvement with top soil

and giass seeding during the growing season in which the completion of the demolition

occnis, or in the n-ext immediate growing season thereafter, and the development of the

turf to a level acceptable to the city, which normally would mean four inches of topsoil

with good germinaiion of grass seeding. ln addition, there shall be submitted within 30

Oays of tne completion of the demolition, a detailed development plan for the site, which

stritt Oe submitted to the department of licenses and inspections.

(code 1968, $ 24-3;Ord.No. 91-079, $ 1, 1l-7-91; Ord. No. 91-082, $ 1, I l-21-91; Ord' No.
,)z-Otl , $ 1 , 3-,5-92; Ord. No. 92-027 , 5 I, 5-14-92; Ord. No. 92-036, S I, 5-21-92; ord. No. 92-

049, $ t, e-lg-gZ; Ord. No. 92-053(sub 1), $$ 1(c), 7(a), (b), (d), (e), (k),7-2-92; Ord' No' 93-

050; $ {,7-8-93;ord. No. 93-070, $ 1, 10-7-93; ord. No. 94-002, $$ 2, 3,2-24-94; ord. No' 94-

052; $ t, s-ts-g+; ord. No. 94-043(sub 1), $ I ,9-29-94; ord. No. 95-029, $ 1, 5-18-95; ord. No,
gs-yil,g t, t-+-lO; Ord. No. 95-078, $ 1, 1-4-96;ord. No. 96-013, S 1,3-22-96; ord. No. 96-

020, $ ti+-tz-ga; ord, No. 96-046, $$ 2, 3, 7^17-96; ord. No. 97-016, g l, 4-3-97; ord' No. 97-

024isub-1), $ 1,4-t7-97; ord. No. 97-039(sub 1), g 1,7-2-97; ord. No. 97-055,51,8-27-97;

ord. No. 97-06,5, S l,9-25-97; ord. No. 97-066(sub 2), $ 2, 1-8-98; Ord. No. 97-115, $ I' i-8-

Page 41-



g8; ord. No. 97-116, $ t, 1-8-98; Ord. No. 98-025, $ 1, 3-5-98; Ord. No. 98-067(sub l), $ 1, 12-

22-98;ord. No. 98-0il(sub 1), $ 1, 8-6-98; ord, No. 98-088, $ 1, 8-13-98; ord' No. 98-115, $ 1,

9-30-98; Ord. No. 98-123(sub 1), $ l, 11-9-98; Ord. No. 98-124, $ 1, 10-19-98; Ord. No' 98-

155(sub 1), $ 2, 6-3-99; Ord. No. gg-045, $ 1, 5-20-99; Ord. No. 99-80, 51,9-23-99; Ord. No.

gg-dgt, S'1,-9-23-99; Ord. No. 99-082(sub l), $ 1, 1l-4-99; Ord. No. 99-103(sub 1), $ 1, 10-7-

99; ord. No. 00-008, g 1, 2-3-00; ord. No. 00-036, g 1, 5-4-00; ord. No. 99-008, $ 1, 5-17-01;

Ord. No. 02-022, S t,-3-21-02; Ord. No. 03-019(sub 2), $ 1, 5-1-03; Ord. No. 03-075(sub 1), $ 7,

l2-4-03;Ord. No. 03 -072, g 1,72-4-03; Ord' No. 04-064(sub l), $ 1, 10-7-04; Ord' No' 04-071,

$ t, t0-i-04; ord. No. 05-045(sub t), $ 1, 8-18-05; ord. No, 05-091(sub 1), g 2, 2-16-06; ord.

No. OO-O+Z(sub 1), $ 1,7-6-06; Ord. No. 06-059(sub 1), $ 1, 9'7'06; Ord' No. 08-053, $ 1,7-10-

0g; Ord. No. 09-005lsub t), g 1,4-2-09; Ord. No. 09-076, $$ 1, 2, l-7-10; Ord. No. 11-017, $ 1,

5-5-1 1 ; Ord. No, 13-034(sub 2), 5 2, 2-20-14;Ord' No' 14-002, 5 1,2-20'14)

Page 42


